o9, fedmae g<en, 09 \goﬂé, 2020 /18 3MMNTa, 1942 1429
AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Himachal Pradesh Ordinance No. 4 of 2020

THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES (HIMACHAL PRADESH
AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020

Promulgated by the Governor of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-first Year of the
Republic of India.

AN ORDINANCE, to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) in
its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh.

WHEREAS, the Legidative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh is not in session and the
Governor of the State of Himacha Pradesh is satisfied that the circumstances exists which render it
necessary for him to take immediate action;

NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of
the Constitution of India, the Governor of Himachal Pradesh is pleased to promulgate the following
Ordinance:—

1. Short title—This Ordinance may be called the Industrial Disputes (Himachal Pradesh
Amendment) Ordinance, 2020.

2. Amendment of Section 22.—In Section 22 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, in its
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”), in sub-
sections (1) and (2), after the words "public utility service", the words "and non-public utility
service" shall beinserted.

3. Amendment of Section 25F.—In Section 25 F of the principa Act, in clause (b), for
the words "fifteen days", the words “sixty days’ shall be substituted.

4.  Amendment of section 25K.—In Section 25 K of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the words "one hundred", the words "two hundred" shall be substituted.

Sd/-
(BANDARU DATTATREYA),
Governor,
Himachal Pradesh
Sd/-
(YASHWANT SINGH CHOGAL),
Principal Secretary (Law).

Shimla:
Dated ........... 2020

[N

H el fqare (fBHrae UQer |RIeH) JEITQel, 2020 & SUYd UG e bl HRd
% AU T 0T 348 (3) B M INUF (3—7Toic), FHEA Ue H USRI U S &
forg uTferepd e & |

T T,

o
RISgUTe], TedTdel U |




