
 

 

1429jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 09 tqykbZ] 2020@18 vk"kk<+] 1942         
AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT 

 
     Himachal Pradesh Ordinance  No. 4 of 2020 

 
THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES (HIMACHAL PRADESH 

                        AMENDMENT) ORDINANCE, 2020 
 
 Promulgated by the Governor of Himachal Pradesh in the Seventy-first Year of the 
Republic of India.  
 AN ORDINANCE, to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) in 
its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh. 
 
 WHEREAS, the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh is not in session and the 
Governor of the State of Himachal Pradesh is satisfied that the circumstances exists which render it 
necessary for him to take immediate action; 
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of article 213 of 
the Constitution of India, the Governor of Himachal Pradesh is pleased to promulgate the following 
Ordinance:— 
  
 1. Short title.—This Ordinance may be called the Industrial Disputes (Himachal Pradesh 
Amendment) Ordinance, 2020. 
 

 2. Amendment of Section 22.—In Section 22 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, in its 
application to the State of Himachal Pradesh (hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”), in sub-
sections (1) and (2), after the words "public utility service", the words "and non-public utility 
service" shall be inserted. 
 

 3. Amendment of Section 25F.—In Section 25 F of the principal Act, in clause (b), for 
the words "fifteen days", the words “sixty days” shall be substituted. 
 

 4. Amendment of section 25K.—In Section 25 K of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), 
for the words "one hundred", the words "two hundred" shall be substituted. 
 

Sd/- 
(BANDARU DATTATREYA), 

Governor,  
Himachal Pradesh 

 

Sd/- 
(YASHWANT SINGH CHOGAL), 
              Principal Secretary (Law). 
 

Shimla: 
Dated ……….. 2020 

_________ 

 
 eSa vkS|ksfxd fookn ¼fgekpy izns'k la'kks/ku½ v/;kns'k] 2020 ds mi;qZDr vaxzsth vuqokn dks Hkkjr 
ds lafo/kku ds vuqPNsn 348 ¼3½ ds v/khu  jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½] fgekpy izns'k esa izdkf'kr fd, tkus ds 
fy, izkf/kd`r djrk gwaA 

 
                                                          caMk: nRrk=s;]             

                       jkT;iky] fgekpy izns'kA 


