This is a digitally signed Gazette, to verify click here.
http://rajpatrahimachal. nic.in

o194, feATae uaer

AT U9 U I g RT UhIiRid

dRAR, 27 SIHANT, 2022 /7 HTE, 1943

fRArd o9 WRaR
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION

Shimla-171 002, the 18th January, 2022

No. PBW(B&R)(B) F (7)-2/2018.—In continuation to this department notification of
even number dated 12th August, 2021, the Governor, Himachal Pradesh is pleased to declare the
following mentioned road as Major District Road.

198—ToTYH / 2022—27—01—2022 (6995)



6996 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

SI. Name of Road District Length MDR
No. (Kms) No's
109 | Bashan to Kalhani Mandi 22.000 118
110 | Banjar-Bahu- Gadagushani-Chhatri- Kullu/Mandi 81.150 119
Magrulla-Janjehli (via Billagad).

Accordingly the total length of Major District Roads in the State will be 4703.185 kms.

By order,

Sd/-

(Subhasish Panda),
Principal Secretary (PW).

TRANSPORT DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION
Shimla-2, the 24th January, 2022

No. TPT-C (9)-4/2017-Loose.—The Governor, Himachal Pradesh in exercise of the
powers conferred by sub-section (6) of Section-41 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (No. 59 of
1988) and all other powers enabling him in this behalf is pleased to allot /release registration
marks/number from Serial No.0001 to 9999 under the Registration marks HP 40F to Registering
and Licensing Authority, Kangra, District Kangra, Himachal Pradesh for registration of motor
vehicles with effect from the publication of this notification in the H.P. Rajpatra (Extra Ordinary)
in the public interest.

By order,

Jagdish Chander Sharma, IAS,
Additional Chief Secretary (Transport).

TRANSPORT DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION
Shimla-2, 24th January, 2022

No. TPT-A(4)-1/2021.—The Governor, Himachal Pradesh on the recommendations of
Selection Committee, is pleased to appoint Er. Ajay Sharma, Chief General Manager Ropeway and
Rapid Transport Development Corporation Limited, as Director in Ropeway and Rapid Transport
System Development Corporation Limited (RTDC), Himachal Pradesh on the usual terms and
conditions as notified by the Managing Director, Ropeway and Rapid Transport System
Development Corporation Limited (RTDC) vide Notification No. RTDC/Service Committee/
2021/7120 dated 04-10-2021. The appointment shall be effective from the date of taking over the
charge of Director, Ropeway and Rapid Transport Development Corporation Ltd., Himachal
Pradesh.

By order,

JAGDISH CHANDER SHARMA,
Additional Chief Secretary (Transport).



ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 6997
EALRCRIK

IHAT—2, 17 STaN], 2021

AT TI0—N—TH(1)—25 / 2021.—ar3il 1 Ggfaensi a1 Ferdfeal & uRa™ & forg
JMER P Y Ugd TS & W0 H IUANT, WRGR DI RS Ulhar dT FIH §91d1 e,
URERIAT 3R S&rdl ofral & AR il &1 giaemrere iR ey Afd H el ugars arfed
PR B Ig[AY SIS YA PR DI JMATIDBAT BEIPR, YETT: S MU ThaIRIT UK PR
vk ICRI IS

FY furT (B 5899 $9@ U=dq [99RT &8l 11 8) fhaml & 9 Wdl &l STl
SRl ¥ e IR b Y, I8 A B FaRAT FRATBR FEIdl o =g UF 6l
THO—URHLTA(TA)6—5 /2016 (THUHGUHATg) dicl. 11, TRIG 31—08—2019 ®I NI I A=A
Y R Ao (R S99 s UREq WM el AT 2), WG @R @l ', oM @i

freeme fRarae ucer, Rmer—5 (RN S99 39@ Uvdn Siaaad A0 H'l T 8) &

qegE  Braifad fhar W1 W ©;

W & rtd, frart (e s g9 uwarq areft @er T ®) &1 faffr ger a1
e O PicaR IR AR =HAfeld 9¢ oM @ oy 50 Ufoerd, AR arferd dre (afddTd) o
% fog 80 ufterd (WHETRI®) 85 Ul 3R Hulfvle T8 oM & forg 70 wioera @ =i

FEFAT (B 5949 39 Ugarq Ugaer &el 1 ©) faed™ WM & Arfesie gl & 3TgaR

BRI IAABRIT gRT TaTd BT Sl ©;

qaigd o H RAEe e I 3 |fa M § W [Swrd B S aren siadt 3y
e

31 fRHTEd US¥ & XIgUTd, SMUR (faxiig &R o=y Herifdal, ugfaenai ik |dreli &1
dfead uRem) srfafa, 2016 (R S9H S99& Uvalq Sad AfITH H-T 41 €) & 9RT 7 §RT
g il &I JAnT axd gy, ferRad siffgfaa o €, steiq—

1. (1) W & r<Fd YGaTg Ui oA & forg urE il aafe d7 yaggRT smR
AT IRUT FHR BT WA IR BAT BT T MR ATAYHTOT UTed HIAT 81T |

(2) wPM & oFid UGMAEY UT B I 9181 WA Tl iy Afte, RNTHd 9 MR
A& gl B AT Sl I A% MR & fofy AMifhd 781 8, & WM & forw RGBT 9 g
YR & AMIBA & Y e BT AU BN A g8 I ARFH @1 gRT 3 & JATAR
MR SIAYTT BT B foTU EHER & 3R VA Afte MR BT 1AM HRA™ & forg fhedl R
IRITAT B (T MRA fafie gga TTffiaxor (J03m$0$10T03M80) d9dge www.uidai.gov.
U IR SUA 7) IR SIUAr:

(3) SR (AF®HA R orerde) fafm, 2016 @& AW 12 & AR, I &1 e+
JMAIHAT & O 3 dh MR & oIy AHifed A8 8 3R Ife Faftla wvs a1 dediia § &le
MR MG & aRYT T8l &, d fIWIT U ST IAHRT & ARTH A IIMS ST &
e IVER & FA0 I Gauro e RIFl IR I1 393 8 IS SIgels INRgR &I afad i
TR AT GIAT U&TT DA

W] 99 b DI e P YR FAILRMA Tl fbar Sar 8, 99 db W e @
FrfelRad SXATS URgd R & 31Tl WhIF & Sl UG Ua @l S, ferid—




6998 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

(@) afs g8 D! MR PATIY UgAE U & A1 ARG fohar a1 8, a1 B!
MR IITAT UgA gdl; 3R

(@) fr=foRaa # & 31 <o 2, erfq—
(i) wrer |fzd @ a1 URe Sy urdg®; AT
(i) Y "rar d@ (GovovHo0) Frs; a1
(iii) TrIaIE; A

(iv) <TeE @rs; A
(v) Hd<rdr yga U, a1

(vi) #RT BrS; AT
(vii) fraTT WIeT urIga; ar

(viii)AleR a1 MfAfR,1988 (1988 &1 59) & MM STSUA UGN §RT IR
=TT AT, AT

(ix) IoUfd AHRT a1 TEdleieR §RT INa ST R oK W Jfdd @
BICT &I Uga dlell YHI0T U, AT

(x) T gRT gTfaffds oI5 g S=dTdon:

R I8 b SWIF xddell @ Wi 9T gR1 89w @ fou fafifde wg |
TmfAfds fedl AfEeRT gRT &1 STg |

2. WM & IJHId Gaargdd ARl I Ugfauy SUdel dRaM & SR 9§ faWnT
U BRI AMHIOT & HEFH U Y8 GEREd PR & oIy T AUferd Fgaweng s b
IF AR BT 3UeTRll & A=Y H, ST GNwd R D (oY, AMIRAl g ASA & Aregd
W, D JAR fHar SIQ |

3. 99 OFK AWl H STl MRl & R (JUdhT) JRMIgH & HIRT AT
3 BRI ¥, YR YAV B Redl &, g8l HRad IuaRicAs fhanfafdr sifiaa @1
STTQARY, 3ref—

(@) U Il B FETeIC] HI G H, ARYATE B ARG BT Yl & Fbd I A8
JFfEvAT Fiaer sRfigd &1 S, TEERT [A9RT U1 BRI AWHRT & AIH § YA &
fog fafy AfT # ggfoensii & aRem =g STl—BTa ARYHH |fed o &1 el & W a1
TERT SRAYHTI o oY ARy B,

(@) Sl BIU AT 7RG DI Yool I Wb I <8 JAYACH & AIH A JRHCH
JNATATIT ®T AT B AT H, W&l Hal W A IR UgI 8, Jgi IMAyArH Hifd a#7a
Jyar |fed, IARAN, TH JTd AR UAds AT FHIEIRG Th 30 Urds gRI UM fdar
SITYAT;

(M) B9 GEK oY HAMAl H, S8l dAigd AT Uh 9 SMER Urids AT FHY IAEMRT
U YT URIGS SUYHIO WG T8l ©, g8l WhiF & Iid UGfIUTg g R 997 (31eR) &
MR TR &1 ST Fhl, R IRITHATOewar eR IR Jiad R TR (RIIR.) Dle & AIH




ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 6999

A I BT A R T TR (R[3MR.) DS BT 3 o (U & forg) & forg fawmmr
ERT §9d BRI AMHIOT & ATIH W GIAETod M TR ATaLID Rl Bl ST |

4. IWRET & AfIRFT I8 FHAREd =7 & e ¥, & B adfds el @E &
mm%&mjﬁm@r@aﬁaﬁﬁ fIMRT oI STIRIA JAMERUT & ARIH A SI0910210
fie, dfdmic dBcRue, MRA AR & FATEI A0 aNE 19 R, 2017 H o ARIRE

3UaTE T FUeH &R @ oy fohanfafdr &1 SrgaRer & |
5. U8 ARGA Iorud (§—Toie), e ueer # SHa UHTed @ aRg ¥ U gl |
SICN N

FEIRT / —
afea (@) |

c

[Authoritative English text of this Department Notification No. Agr-B-F(1)-25/2021, dated
17-01-2022 as required under Article 348 (3) of Constitution of India].

AGRICULTURE DEPARTMENT
NOTIFICATION
Shimla-2, the 17th January, 2022

No. Agr-B-F(1)-25/2021.—Whereas, the use of Aadhaar as an identity document for
delivery of services or benefits or subsidies simplifies the Government delivery processes, brings
in transparency and efficiency, and enables beneficiaries to get their entitlements directly in a
convenient and seamless manner by obviating the need to produce multiple documents to prove
one’s identity;

And whereas, the Department of Agriculture (hereinafter referred to as the Department), is
administering the “Mukhya Mantri Khet Sanrakshan Yojna” (hereinafter referred to as the Scheme)
issued vide letter No. Agr.SC.H(H)6-35/2016(MMKSY)-Vol.-11I, dated 31-08-2019 to help the
farmers by providing the fencing in their fields to protect from wild animals which is being
implemented through the Directorate of Agriculture, Himachal Pradesh, Shimla-5 (hereinafter
referred to as the Implementing Agency);

And whereas, under the Scheme, financial assistance in different types of fencing provided
as 50% in Barbed and Interlink chain, 80% in Solar Fencing (Individual), 85% (Community)
and 70% Composite Fencing (hereinafter referred to as the benefit) is given to the agricultural
farmers (hereinafter referred to as the beneficiaries), by the Implementing Agency as per the extant
Scheme guidelines;

And whereas, the aforesaid Scheme involves recurring expenditure incurred from the
Consolidated Fund of Himachal Pradesh;

Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by section 7 of the Aadhaar (Targeted
Delivery of Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016, the Governor,
Himachal Pradesh is pleased to notify following, namely:—

1. (1) An individual eligible for receiving the benefits under the Scheme shall hereby be
required to furnish proof of possession of the Aadhaar number or undergo Aadhaar authentication.



7000 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

(2) Any individual desirous of availing benefits under the Scheme, who does not possess
the Aadhaar number or, has not yet enrolled for Aadhaar, shall be required to make application for
Aadhaar enrolment before registering for the Scheme provided that he is entitled to obtain Aadhaar
as per section 3 of the said Act, and such individuals shall visit any Aadhaar enrolment centre [list
available at the Unique Identification Authority of India (UIDAI) website www.uidai.gov.in] to get
enrolled for Aadhaar.

(3) As per regulation 12 of the Aadhaar (Enrolment and Update) Regulations, 2016, the
Department through its Implementing Agency, is required to offer Aadhaar enrolment facilities for
the beneficiaries who are not yet enrolled for Aadhaar and in case there is no Aadhaar enrolment
centre located in the respective Block or Tehsil, the Department through its Implementing Agency
shall provide Aadhaar enrolment facilities at convenient locations in co-ordination with the existing
Registrars of UIDAI or by becoming a UIDAI Registrar themselves:

Provided that till the time Aadhaar is assigned to the individual, benefits under the Scheme
shall be given to such individual, subject to the production of the following documents, namely :—

(a) if he has enrolled, his Aadhaar Enrolment Identification slip; and
(b) any one of the following documents, namely:—

(i) Bank or Post Office Passbook with Photo; or

(i1)) Permanent Account Number (PAN) Card; or

(ii1) Passport; or

(iv) Ration Card; or

(v) Voter Identity Card; or

(vi) MGNREGA card; or

(vii) Kisan Photo passbook; or

(viii)Driving license issued by the Licensing Authority under the Motor Vehicles Act,
1988 (59 of 1988); or

(ix) Certificate of identity having photo of such person issued by a Gazetted Officer or
a Tehsildar on an official letter head; or

(x) any other document as specified by the Department:

Provided further that the above documents may be checked by an officer specifically
designated by the Department for that purpose.

2. In order to provide benefits to the beneficiaries under the Scheme conveniently, the
Department through its Implementing Agency shall make all the required arrangements to ensure
that wide publicity through the media shall be given to the beneficiaries to make them aware of the
said requirement.



ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7001

3. In all cases, where Aadhaar authentication fails due to poor biometrics of the
beneficiaries or due to any other reason, the following remedial mechanisms shall be adopted,
namely:—

(a) in case of poor fingerprint quality, iris scan or face authentication facility shall be
adopted for authentication, thereby the Department through its Implementing Agency shall make
provisions for iris scanners or face authentication along with finger-print authentication for delivery
of benefits in seamless manner;

(b) in case the biometric authentication through fingerprints or iris scan or face
authentication is not successful, wherever feasible and admissible authentication by Aadhaar One

Time Password or Time-based One-Time Password with limited time validity, as the case may be,
shall be offered;

(c) 1in all other cases where biometric or Aadhaar One Time Password or Time-based One-
Time Password authentication is not possible, benefits under the Scheme may be given on the basis
of physical Aadhaar letter whose authenticity can be verified through the Quick Response code
printed on the Aadhaar letter and the necessary arrangement of Quick Response code reader shall
be provided at the convenient locations by the Department through its Implementing Agency.

4. In addition to the above, in order to ensure that no bonafide beneficiary under the
Scheme is deprived of his due benefits, the Department through its Implementing Agency shall
follow the exception handling mechanism as outlined in the Office Memorandum of DBT Mission,
Cabinet Secretariat, Government of India dated 19th December 2017.

5. This notification shall come into effect from the date of its publication in the Rajpatra
(e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh.

By order,

Sd/-
Secretary (Agr.).

CALREGING

c

BreT—2, 17 STHaY), 2021

T TI0—N—TB(1)—27 / 2021.—@msll a1 Ugfaensii a1 Ferdfdal & uReq & forg
IR HT Th YgdM TIPS & WU H IWN, WHR P UREH Uhar & GIH 99101 &,
URERIAT 3R S&dT oal § AR Al &I giaereds iR ey AT H U+l ugas arfed
PR D IEAY SIS UG DI DI ATLIHAT BEIIR, T 2 MU SHaINIT UKl B+
B FHT AT B

FY farT (B 599 s9a ggarq AT &1 a1 &) Riers & g @ oy SoTs
% 2500 AR U IUAL FRATPR [HAHl I G g AR RiErg deEr ([ gwH
qeETq WhIH HET AT 7) YRR &R @1 &, o Y Fewred, Bamed e (B saH
qeAT ST JAMTHIUT HET TAT 8) B AIH | BRi-ad [Har 5 & ;

4




7002 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

T B A BN H a1 T (B2 s9d 39 uvarq il S8 T ©), oY
3R AT frami @1 85 ufaerd &R 7egH &R 9% faml @1 80 wfarerd @t faxiy seran, (R

SAH SAD U UYfAET del AT 7) [AEHE WH & Arieie gl & JIR BRI
BRI §RT YST B SR ;

qaigd o H RAEe uee o & |fa M § W [wrd B S aren sadt g
rdferd

31 fRATEd US¥ & XIgUTd, SMUR (faxiig &R o=y Herfifdal, ugfaenai iRk |dreli &1
dfead uRem) srfafa, 2016 (R S9H S99& Uvanq Sad AfITH H'T 41 8) & ORT 7 §RT
ged il &I JANT axd gy, forRaa siffegfaa &xd €, s1eiq—

1 (1) T & Id UGG 9T &1 & fog U $18 afie & TdggRT SR
AT FRYT HR BT FY UK BRAT BT AT MR AYATO YT DHRAT ST |

(2) M & A UG YT B Pl qBT @A dqlell blg e, e T 3R

TR YT BT B foIU FhaR & MR T e MR BT IRATIIT HRA™ & foIU sl ImeR
IR Hes [l IR ARTT ggad uifdaxer (g0 M50 S0 Yo 3MM=80) dd9Ise
www.uidai.gov. in TR U 8] UR TG

(3) MR ([AHIEA AR o) A, 2016 & AFRM 12 & AR, fA9WT &I 8
AMMATIHAT & Sif 3P I MR & forv dAm™ifed F8l & IR afe Fdfa @vs a1 asdia # a1
MR MG Bvx fART &l &, A [T U BIIII TWHRUT & ARIH | IS SIYels &
fIemm IR & 9= 9 Flaureme W R 1 WA & JRSSIgens IR &1 eRad 4
MR TS GIAETY &I BT

W] Od T B A B AWR AR 8] [Bal Sl &, 99 db (4d @fe @l
FfeTRad STt IR R & JeF ¥hIH b ST TYAE TaTT Bl Y, Jefiqi—

(@) IfE a8 ISP JR JIAYA UgaE U9 & A1 WA fhar a7 & o Sqal
MR IITAT Ugd gdi; 3R

(@) FrefaRed ¥ 9 IS &S 8, Jid—
(i) wrer \fed 4o a1 uRe A uragsd; Al
(i) Y @A F@ (GoT0TH0) Hrs; I
(iti) oTare; AT
(iv) T BrS; AT
(v) WIS ygd U, AT
vi) AT BrS; AT

(vii) T¥TT WIeT urAge; a1




ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7003
(vii)ATex I MMM, 1988 (1988 ®T 59) @ IMefF AU UGN §RT SR
AT AT, AT

(ix) oMUl IfEHERI 1 TeddeR §RT I YAl TR SN U fdd & I
P YSAE aTedT JATOT UH; AT

x) T grT gfafAfds oI5 3 S=dTdon:

WRe] I8 b SWIFd TWESl B Sid MR gRT 89 WdioE & foy faffde wu 4
TEfAfdse fEdl AfEeRI gRT &I STQ |

2. WM & Ira Glaumgad ARl & TRIAU] Sude HRaM & S W AW *e
BRI AMBIU & AIH A I8 GAREd DR & oIy THKT AU ey Bl b I
AT BT LTIl & A= W, I SFTed B & (o, ARl gg AT & Aegd 9,
YD TAR fhIT S |

3. 99 GAK AHl | T8l AR & T (JUdRT) drdigd b bR AT BT 3
BRI ¥, AR YAV JHd &dl 7, a8l FfoRad Swarrets fhanfafdy offtga @ e,
rfq—

() AT Al BIY F@TIC] B QT H, FAYAVM B ARG DI Ydell & Wb IT &I
forg frafy AR A ggfaemetl & IRSM B STC—BTU IAYAVM Ald A BT el & Wb a1
UERT FRATHOH & oy @raRemd R,

(@) ST BT AT ARG B Gdell I Tba AT IS ARYHAOE & AIH F qREAMCH
YA DI A AHeAdT Dl <2 H, el FHel W Ay AR y"y 2, 9.l Afmmee i wwa
Jyar |fed, AR, UHh JTd AR Ugas AT FHIEIRG Uh 3 Urqds gRI U fdar
SITQT,

(1) ST WEK 3T HMGl H, WIEl qEfied A1 UH 9 SMER URIds AT FHI AEMRT
U YT URIGS SUYHIO WG T8l ©, g8l WhiF & SIrid AUy IR IR 997 (31EeR) &
MR TR &1 ST Fhl, T IRIuHATOreRar eR IR Jiad R TR (RIIR.) IS & AIH
A FAMT B S AR R TR (F3TR.) Dls BT 3f o (Ugd & o) & fory fawmr
ERT 3HG FHIATGAT MBIV & ARIH A GlAETod Rl IR AaeId el Bl ST |

4, SWET & ARF T8 GERETT B & IR ¥, 6 By ardidd el e &
=TI Sl <F ugfawreli ¥ dfed 9 8, MR e BRI JfeReT & JeEs | S10d10<0

oM, dfedc AheRue, YR WRHR & BRI U9 dRg 19 fe@wR, 2017 § JU7 ARIRG

3uare &1 Fuer &1 & oy fhanfafdr &1 srgaRoer & |

5. I SRS SIS (§—7Toie), ZAEd Usel H $9a UHRM &l R A g 8i |

ST ENT,

FEIRT / —
afea (@) |

c



7004 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

[Authoritative English text of this Department Notification No. Agr-B-F(1)-27/2021, dated
17-01-2022 as required under Article 348 (3) of Constitution of India].

AGRICULTURE DEPARTMENT

NOTIFICATION
Shimla-2, the 17th January, 2022

No. Agr-B-F(1)-27/2021.—Whereas, the use of Aadhaar as an identity document for
delivery of services or benefits or subsidies simplifies the Government delivery processes, brings in
transparency and efficiency, and enables beneficiaries to get their entitlements directly in a
convenient and seamless manner by obviating the need to produce multiple documents to prove
one’s identity;

And whereas, the Department of Agriculture (hereinafter referred to as the Department), is
administering the “Saur Sinchayee Yojna” (hereinafter referred to as the Scheme) to help the
farmers by providing solar pumps to lift the water for irrigation purpose which is being
implemented through the Directorate of Agriculture, Himachal Pradesh, Shimla-5 (hereinafter
referred to as the Implementing Agency);

And whereas, under the Scheme, financial assistance is provided as 85% for Small and
Marginal farmers and 80% for Medium and Big farmers (hereinafter referred to as the benefit) is
given to the farmers having agricultural land (hereinafter referred to as the beneficiaries), by the
Implementing Agency as per the extant Scheme guidelines;

And whereas, the aforesaid Scheme involves recurring expenditure incurred from the
Consolidated Fund of Himachal Pradesh;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 7 of the Aadhaar (Targeted
Delivery of Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016 (18 of 2016)
(hereinafter referred to as the said Act), the Governor, Himachal Pradesh is pleased to notify
following, namely:—

1. (1) An individual eligible for receiving the benefits under the Scheme shall hereby be
required to furnish proof of possession of the Aadhaar number or undergo Aadhaar authentication.

(2) Any individual desirous of availing benefits under the Scheme, who does not possess
the Aadhaar number or, has not yet enrolled for Aadhaar, shall be required to make application for
Aadhaar enrolment before registering for the Scheme provided that he is entitled to obtain Aadhaar
as per section 3 of the said Act, and such individuals shall visit any Aadhaar enrolment centre [list
available at the Unique Identification Authority of India (UIDAI) website www.uidai.gov.in] to get
enrolled for Aadhaar.

(3) As per regulation 12 of the Aadhaar (Enrolment and Update) Regulations, 2016, the
Department through its Implementing Agency, is required to offer Aadhaar enrolment facilities for
the beneficiaries who are not yet enrolled for Aadhaar and in case there is no Aadhaar enrolment
centre located in the respective Block or Taluka or Tehsil, the Department through its
Implementing Agency shall provide Aadhaar enrolment facilities at convenient locations in co-
ordination with the existing Registrars of UIDAI or by becoming a UIDAI Registrar themselves:

Provided that till the time Aadhaar is assigned to the individual, benefits under the Scheme
shall be given to such individual, subject to the production of the following documents, namely:—



ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7005

(a) if he has enrolled, his Aadhaar Enrolment Identification slip; and

(b) any one of the following documents, namely:—
(i) Bank or Post Office Passbook with Photo; or
(i1)) Permanent Account Number (PAN) Card; or
(ii1) Passport; or
(iv) Ration Card; or

(v) Voter Identity Card; or
(vi) MGNREGA card; or

(vii) Kisan Photo passbook; or

(viii)Driving license issued by the Licensing Authority under the Motor Vehicles Act,
1988 (59 of 1988); or

(ix) Certificate of identity having photo of such person issued by a Gazetted Officer or
a Tehsildar on an official letter head; or

(x) any other document as specified by the Department:

Provided further that the above documents may be checked by an officer specifically
designated by the Department for that purpose.

2. In order to provide benefits to the beneficiaries under the Scheme conveniently, the
Department through its Implementing Agency shall make all the required arrangements to ensure
that wide publicity through the media shall be given to the beneficiaries to make them aware of the
said requirement.

3. In all cases, where Aadhaar authentication fails due to poor biometrics of the
beneficiaries or due to any other reason, the following remedial mechanisms shall be adopted,
namely:—

(a) in case of poor fingerprint quality, iris scan or face authentication facility shall be
adopted for authentication, thereby the Department through its Implementing Agency shall make
provisions for iris scanners or face authentication along with finger-print authentication for delivery
of benefits in seamless manner;

(b) in case the biometric authentication through fingerprints or iris scan or face
authentication is not successful, wherever feasible and admissible authentication by Aadhaar One
Time Password or Time-based One-Time Password with limited time validity, as the case may be,
shall be offered;

(c) 1in all other cases where biometric or Aadhaar One Time Password or Time-based One-
Time Password authentication is not possible, benefits under the Scheme may be given on the
basis of physical Aadhaar letter whose authenticity can be verified through the Quick Response
code printed on the Aadhaar letter and the necessary arrangement of Quick Response code reader
shall be provided at the convenient locations by the Department through its Implementing Agency.



7006 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

4. In addition to the above, in order to ensure that no bona fide beneficiary under the
Scheme is deprived of his due benefits, the Department through its Implementing Agency shall
follow the exception handling mechanism as outlined in the Office Memorandum of DBT Mission,
Cabinet Secretariat, Government of India dated 19th December, 2017.

5. This notification shall come into effect from the date of its publication in the Rajpatra
(e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh.

By order,

Sd/-
Secretary (Agr.).

HIMACHAL PRADESH ELECTRICITY REGULATORY COMMISSION, SHIMLA
NOTIFICATION
Shimla, the 20th January, 2022

HPERC-(H)(1)-1/2012.—The Himachal Pradesh Electricity Regulatory Commission in
exercise of the powers conferred under Clauses (r) and (s) of sub-section (2) of Section 181, read
with sub-sections (5) to (8) of Section 42, of the Electricity Act, 2003 (36 of 2003) and all other
powers enabling it in this behalf, after previous publication, hereby makes the following
amendment in the Himachal Pradesh Electricity Regulatory Commission (Consumer Grievances
Redressal Forum and Ombudsman) Regulations, 2013, namely:—

REGULATIONS

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These Regulations may be called the Himachal
Pradesh Electricity Regulatory Commission (Consumer Grievances Redressal Forum and
Ombudsman) (Second Amendment) Regulations, 2022.

(2) These Regulations shall come into force from the date of their publication in the
Rajpatra, Himachal Pradesh.

2. Amendment of Regulation 3.—In Regulation 3 of the said Regulations.—In Sub-
regulation (1), for item (f), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“® “Forum” means a Forum, established or to be established, by the distribution licensee
under sub-section (5) of Section 42 of the Act, as per the guidelines contained in these
Regulations;”

3. Amendment of Regulation 5.—In Regulation S of the said Regulations.—(i) in
Sub-regulation (1), for the sign “” shall be substituted and the proviso thereto
shall be omitted; and

I3 E]

., the sign

(i1)) for Sub-regulation (2), the following shall be substituted, namely :- “(2) The
distribution licensee may, after considering various related factors such as the number of consumers
under different categories of retail tariff, number of representations generally received and disposed
of, ease of access for the consumers in the various areas, establish by order, under intimation to the



ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7007

Commission, additional Forum in its area of supply and in that event each Forum shall have the
jurisdiction, linked to any one or more relevant parameters such as geographical/operational areas,
the tariff related categories of consumers etc., as the distribution licensee may, by order, define
from time to time:

Provided that in addition to the Forum established as per Sub-regulation (1), the distribution
licensee, shall, latest by 30th April, 2022, also establish under intimation to the Commission, at
least one additional Forum for each of its operation circles and the jurisdiction thereof in relation to
the consumers under the respective operation circles, shall be as follows, namely :—

(1) 1in case of the consumers covered under single part retail tariff- all types of complaints,
whether monetary or non- monetary ; and

(i) in case of the consumers covered under two part retail tariff — all types of complaints
whether monetary or non monetary, where the following conditions are met —

(a) the amount of dispute / claim does not exceed two lakh in each case; and
(b) the standard supply voltage does not exceed 22kV:

Provided further that in the event of establishing additional Forums at
Divisional/Sub- divisional level, the distribution licensee shall also modify, under
intimation to the Commission, the territorial jurisdiction of the Forum established
at the head quarter of that Circle.

(3) The Commission may, duly taking into account the factors mentioned in Sub-
regulation (1), direct, from time to time, the distribution licensee to establish, under intimation to
the Commission, the additional Forums at various locations and also to define/modify the
jurisdiction of each Forum established, or to be established, under the provisions of these
Regulations.

(4) The complaints not falling under the jurisdiction of the additional Forums, established
as per Sub-regulation (2) and sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, shall continue to fall under the
jurisdiction of Forum established under Sub- regulation (1) of Regulation 5.

4. Amendment of Regulation 6.—For Regulation 6 of the said Regulations, the
following shall be substituted, namely:—

“6. Headquarters of Forum.—The head quarter of the Forum, established as per Sub-
regulation (1) of Regulation 5, shall preferably be at the head quarter of the distribution
licensee. The head quarter for additional Forums established as per the first proviso to the
sub-regulation (2) of Regulation 5, shall be at the headquarters of the respective operation
circles. The head quarters of the other Forums, if any, established as per sub-regulation (2)
and Sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, shall be fixed by the distribution licensee. Each
Forum may, with the overall objective of ensuring that the complaints/grievances are heard
and redressed within the time limit specified under these Regulations, conduct its sittings
preferably in the areas, within its territorial jurisdiction, having industrial belts, as it may
consider appropriate.”

5. Amendment of Regulation7.—In Regulation 7 of the said Regulations.—

() In sub-regulation (1) —



7008

ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STH4ARI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943

(i)

(i)

[T3%2)

for the sign ““;” appearing in sub-clause (b) of clause (i), the sign “:” shall be
substituted and thereafter the following provisos shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that in case of additional Forum established, or to be established,
as per Sub-regulation (2) and Sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, the
distribution licensee shall designate, on Ex-officio basis, the Members of
each such Forum out of its serving officers having appropriate qualifications,
who shall perform their functions in the said Forums in addition to their
normal assigned duties and out of such designated Members, one Member
shall be designated as Chairperson of that Forum:

Provided further that no officer of a rank of less than Superintending
Engineer shall be designated as Member-cum-Chairperson of any additional
Forum to be established as per first proviso to Sub-regulation (2) of
Regulation 5:

Provided further that the Member, other than that designated as Chairperson
of a Forum shall not be of a rank which is lower, by more than one step, than
the rank held by the Member designated as Chairperson of that Forum:

Provided further that no such officer shall be designated as Member-cum-
Chairperson of an additional Forum established, or to be established as per
Sub-regulation (2) and Sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, who is posted in
operation Sub-division/Division/ Circle, as the case may be, in the territorial
jurisdiction of that Forum or of such other additional Forum which is chaired
by an officer posted in the territorial jurisdiction of that Forum;”; and

for Sub-clause (a) of clause (ii), the following shall be substituted,
namely :(—

“(a) who have retired after serving the State Government or of its
Undertakings at the posts which are not lower, by more than one step, than
the rank held by the Chairperson of that Forum and are familiar with the
consumer affairs or regulatory affairs; or” ; and

(IT) for sub-regulation (3), the following shall be substituted, namely :—

“(3) The licensee shall immediately, but not later than seven days, after the
appointment, or designation, of the Members (other than the Independent Member)
provide details to the Commission regarding qualifications and experience of the
Member(s) so appointed or designated.”

6. Amendment of Regulation 9.—In Regulation 9 of the said Regulations.—

(M)

in sub-regulation (1), for the sign “.”, the sign “:” shall be substituted and
thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely :—

“Provided that in cases where the Members of the Forums are to be designated, on
Ex-officio basis, as per the provisos to clause (i) of sub-regulation (1) of
Regulation 7, the Member designated as such, shall be the Chairperson of that
Forum.” ; and

(i1) in Sub-regulation (3), for the words, brackets, sign and figures “Member appointed

under sub-clause (b) of clause (i) of sub- regulation (1) of regulation 77, the



ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7009

words, brackets, sign and figures “Member appointed under sub-clause (b) of
clause (i) of Sub-regulation (1) of Regulation 7, or the other Member designated
as per the provisos thereto” shall be substituted.

7. Amendment of Regulation 13.—In Regulation 13 of the said Regulations.—In
clause (a) of Sub-regulation (1), for the words “the Members appointed,”, the words and sign “the
Members appointed, or designated on ex-officio basis,” shall be substituted.

8. Amendment of Regulation 14.—In Regulation 14 of the said Regulations.—In
Sub-regulation (2), for the sign “.”, the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the following
proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that in each case where an additional Forum is established as per Sub-regulation
(2) and Sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, the distribution licensee shall designate, on Ex-officio
basis, a suitable serving official, who shall perform his duties as Secretary of the Forum in addition
to his normal assigned duties.”

9. Amendment of Regulation 15.—In Regulation 15 of the said Regulations, at the
end of para, the following sentence shall be added, namely :— “The distribution licensee shall
also provide a link on its web portal and mobile app for registering the complaint/grievance in
relevant Forum and also shall provide online tracking system of the complaints as well as status of
compliance of the Forum’s order by it.”

10. Amendment of Regulation 16.—In Regulation 16 of the said Regulations.—In
Sub-regulation (1), for the words “under the jurisdiction of the Forum”, the words “under the
jurisdiction of the relevant Forum” shall be substituted.

11. Amendment of Regulation 17.—In Regulation 17 of the said Regulations.—
In Sub-regulation (1), for the words and sign “submit his grievance, either in person or through
post, e-mail or fax or online through the website of the Forum”, the words and sign “submit his
grievance to the relevant Forum, through any channel i.e. in person, through post, e- mail, fax,
online through the website / mobile app of the distribution licensee,” shall be substituted.

12. Amendment of Regulation 26.—In Regulation 26 of the said Regulations.—

(I) in Sub-clause (ii) of clause (a) of Sub-regulation (2), for the words and figure “15
percent”, the words and figure “12 percent” shall be substituted,

(IT) in Sub-regulation (4), for the words “The Order of the Forum shall be reasoned”, the
words “The Order of the Forum shall be speaking and reasoned” shall be substituted,
and

(ITI) in Sub-regulation (6), at the end of para, the following new sentence shall be added,
namely :—

“Each such order shall also be displayed on the website of the distribution licensee.”

13. Amendment of Regulation 27.—In Regulation 27 of the said Regulations.—In
Sub-regulation (1), for the words and figure “21 days”, the words and figure “30 days” shall be
substituted.

14. Amendment of Regulation 29.—In Regulation 29 of the said Regulations.—In
clause (a) of Sub-regulation (4), for the words “with regards to levels”, the words “duly taking into
account the levels” shall be substituted.



7010 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

15. Amendment of Regulation 37.—In Regulation 37 of the said Regulations.—In
Sub-regulation (5), for the words and figure “15 days”, the words and figure “30 days” shall be
substituted.

16. Amendment of Regulation 38.—In Regulation 38 of the said Regulations.—In
clause (a) of Sub-regulation (4), for the words “with regards to levels”, the words “duly taking into
account the levels” shall be substituted.

By order of the Commission
Sd/-

(CHAAVI NANTA) Hpas,
Secretary.

¥ T TE® GHTEdl f§dg Aol Ud BRIGR! GUSIRIBRNT eHeell, Tl SHeT,
ftetm wivreT (R0 Wo)

JheHAT [0:  /NT /2021

Sh. Moti Lal s/o Sh. Rattan Chand, r/o Village Barol, P.O. Dari, Tehsil Dharamshala,
District Kangra (H.P.).

ERIE

SMH STd

AT — o T—u5 SR aRT 13(3) fRATEe ucer usiiaxor e, 1969.
Afe M 3MH el |

Sh. Moti Lal s/o Sh. Rattan Chand, r/o Village Barol, P.O. Dari, Tehsil Dharamshala,
District Kangra (H.P.) ¥ $9 3f&Teld H ¥U—U= A2d JHeAT aRR fhar g b a1 91 &1 o1
el 20—03—2003 BT AT & UR=] UHOIO EFTRITSAT/ITH U= H T4 Uil = 2| 37
Ul fhd ST @ offeel 3y Wi | 39 AIfCH & §RT AW ST &I d T aai
B! iua fear oar € fb afe A @1 Madhu d/o Moti Lal & S99 &I Usiigd bl ST aR
PIS TIRTS &I A I8 AN IMETd H feA7d 31—01—2022 BT FATATT IT IHTATT BIOR IATHR
3UT YaRTST URT PR |l © STIAT Halldd wuf—ua o fIfr 20—03—2003 &1 Usilg [
S IR 377 giRd &R & SR |

el fadid 23—12—2021 & WX TWER T AB AT FINEGINY foar T |

e | IR / —
TErd aHEdl fgdid 9ol td dRIeRT gusIfian,
gHeTe, e s (fRovo) |




ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7011

9 IeTd S FHEdl fgdig Aol Ud BRI SUSIfIeR eI, dewiel eRgeT,
fStetr ®iRTsT (fR0 Wo)

Fghedr H0:  /NT /2021

Sh. Ami Chand s/o Late Sh. Chuhru Ram, r/o Village Traimblu, P.O. Dhagwar, Tehsil
Dharamshala, District Kangra (H.P.).

ERIR

3 STeaT
v ——Urei—u5 O gRT 13(3) feArae uaer usiiawor srfiif e, 1969.
e M 3MH ST |

Sh. Ami Chand s/o Late Sh. Chuhru Ram, r/o Village Traimblu, P.O. Dhagwar, Tehsil
Dharamshala, District Kangra (H.P.) 7 9 37aTad H IUg—u4 Afd HDEHAT QIR e & f 7
T8 @1 g f&T1® 15—10—1989 T §8 © U] THOHI0 EFRIA /U™ U=md § J&g Yol 9 © |
3 3 USHipd b O & ey Q¥ SR | 39 AIeH & gRT W9 O9dl bl ai Fwiad
TRl BT G fhar Srar & b afe {61 @1 Sarla Devi d/o Churhu &1 g &1 Usiidd b
S 9R P RISl & df 98 BAN IfaTad H fHAld 31—-01—2022 BT INTAIdd AT Jhlerd
BIOR JATHR JAUAT UARTS UTT B Fehall & UAT Jllded eU—ux Hog Al 15—10—1989 I
Uoflepd fhd ST AR 3Tl uTiRd &Ry SR |

3T fadTd 23—12—2021 BT TR EXER T A 3MaTed SR SR T 13 |

ATER | FAEIRT / —
TerIdh FaTEd! g Soff Ud BrieR] qusIeihR,
T, T BTt (fRowo) |

¥ T TES GHTEdl f§dg Aol Ud SRIGR! GUSIRIBNT eHeell, Tl SHeT,
e st (R0 o)

HhedT H0:  /NT /2021

Sh. Goldi Kumar s/o Soto Ram, r/o Charan Khad, Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra
(H.P.).

ERIE

3 STaT
fawa ——uref—u5 O gRT 13(3) feArae waer ushiawor srfaif e, 1969.

I 999 3MH ST |

Sh. Goldi Kumar s/o Soto Ram, r/o Charan Khad, Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra
(HP)ﬁrsﬂmﬁmu—qav%ﬁwwﬁm%ﬁsﬁéﬁrmwﬁ?@



7012 RO, f3HTerdl Uael, 27 Siel, 2022 /7 HTH, 1943

13—11—2019 ®I B3N B UR=] THOMIO GHEMAT/ITH WA H ST Uoildd o © | 3 39 doilda
P S @ oree AU OIR | 39 A & gRT A ST Bl T I ARl &l gferd
fopar Simar & 6 Jfq f6AT @1 Saniya d/o Goldi Kumar & ¥ &I Usiigd fHd &M aR BIg
TR 8 I 98 89K 3fQTeld | faTid 31—01—2022 P TSI AT dahlefa BIOR JATHY AU
TORTST U1 R Fhdl & AT GaTdd euf—us o4 A 13—11—2019 BT Uoligd & 99 ar
3fTae UTRT PR & IR |

3T fadTd 23—12—2021 BT TR EXER T A 3METed SR SR T 13 |

AER | FARIRT / —
TErIe aHEdl fgdid 9ol U dRIeR! SUsIfEian,

gHeITe, 57 st (fRowo) |

¥ T TE® GHTEdl f§dd 9ol U4 BRIGR! GUSIRIBNT eHeell, Tl SHeT,
e st (R0 o)

Hhedr H0:  /NT /2021

Sh. Pathan Singh s/o Late Sh. Sarad Ram, r/o Village & P.O. Mandal, Tehsil Dharamshala,
District Kangra (H.P.).

ERIk

STH ST dAT

AT — oA T—u5 SR aRT 13(3) fRATEe ucer usiiaxor e, 1969.

A 999 *MH ST |

Sh. Pathan Singh s/o Late Sh. Sarad Ram, r/o Village & P.O. Mandal, Tehsil Dharamshala,
District Kangra (H.P.) T S 3[&TeId H W0I—UF Ad GHeA! IR 6a1 § & A0 97 &1 oA
fasTies 17—11—1981 BT AT T U= UHOHIO EFIRISAT/ITH UIId § & Uoligd = 2| 31 s
Ul fhd ST & offeel A Ri | 39 AIfCH & §RT AW ST &I i Ffd i
B! gud fear Sar § e e fB @I Kumari Pinki d/o Pathan Singh @ S 1 Usilad (&
SM R PHlg UARISl & Al 98 BN J7Glad H QA 31—01—2022 Pl AT AT JhTela
BIOR AThR MU RIS URT R AHAT © AT HAldd AYI—u= o fafd 17—11—1981 I
Uoliepd fhdl ST aR 3fTasl uTiRd &R 3y SR |

ST fRHId 23—12—2021 I WX &R T HIBR 3METerd gIRT SIRT fdoam T |

AER | FeIRT / —
TeId FaTEd! fgaia ool Ud drieR] qusIferar,
gHeITe, e st (fRowo) |



ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7013
9 QMo A9 deNIdeR U4 BRIGRI SUSIRGR, dedrie 81, fofer &irer (fRovo)

& 0 : 18 /NT/2021 TRRT SRINT © 16—08—2021 TIRRG Ul 31—01—2022

foe qo : swaTo o faf

Wiiep— IS AR g1 &7 AT e, Fardil Td, SThER g U™ uaRid S, dediel dR1, el
Firsr  (fBowo) iR |

ERIR

1. Dbl ISRER ST Td JG Uoilrol/ fdars
2. M of9dT YT TOT |

a9 ——UTeAT—u= ol aRT 13(3) 5 / H&Y USHHROT 3TEIH, 1960.

T SR & 59 IR § YHA—u9 99 IUY—99 59 AT A U9 fhar g
IART S M, SIHER 9 UM UARd €y, dedid R, Rtenm wirer (Rowo) # A
18—02—1982 &I BT & | AR JALMAEY IAdI o I Fafd I™ v=ma S5 & offverd H
T 9 2 O P 98 awfd u™ v=aad €5 @ o § g5 draET @gdl § |

3 39 I IAER o 20 Yo 9 HET HATEl gRI SWiad gARdl 9 AIARR Bl
@HWW%%H@W@@N ST TSN gR BIs SolN IT TdRTST &I d 98 o9
$YdeR /AT & SRl 84 & fafsr 9 U A1 & AR 1 feATh 31—01—2022 &I UTd: 10.30 FoF
IATATT AT IbTold 59 ISTold § BIGR 3MHY 3T SR g UaRIol U HR Thdl & | SID
SR ®ls W IR IT TARIST HlEgd FARIT 9 8N T fdfedr @1 o= fafdr fesis
18—02—1982 BT Tol R & ISY TR UTH GATId €5 Bl UIRT B &I TR |

3ITST &A1 31—12—2021 BT R EXIER g HIBR Al 7aTeld A NI §aTT |

AER | FXARIRT / —
IId dedleleR Ud HRIGRT SUSIUDNI,
&R, e swivrer (2o o) |

9 ST S gHEdl g Ao U6 drRieRN) SUSIfRaiy eH3me, dewiel eRigeT,
fStem wireT (fRovo)

JbeAr 50 NT /2021

s g o g3 g 8 Rem (W, FERT Al g1 dbie, ISP @NARI, dgdid
grerTett, Rtenm wirer (fRowo)

ERIE

SMH SId



7014 ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STH4ARI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943
T —umefHT—ua SR gRT 37(2) f2AMES Uaw M ORI R dR |

e 9919 *MH ST |

SN g ot g3 iy s RMem W, MR Aiedl 71 die, ShuR WigRT, dediel
gHerer, fSen wiTeT (fRodo) = 39 IfRTad H WYY—UF WiEd HheAr IR fhar § f6 =1 M
o RePpTS #eTel Sfdge H g ¥ Y3 S T91 & Sifd Taid & SIdics 31 9 Y ol g
e 21 39 ANCA & gRT IR ST DI qAT T Tl & gfea fear omar g & afe
feddl @1 g ot gF il s RM3m M ORI R DI YaRISl 8 Al 98 37Ul YaRTSl sHRI
eTard # fRAi® 31—01—2022 HI ETATH AT IHISATT BIOR IMHX U IR AHAT & 3TFAT
qaTide IL—ud g ot gF Wi Sl RS0 M B AW B GOl Uoligd [ O aR Qe
TR HR & IR |

Mo fedi 23—12—2021 BT BN BEIER T HIBY 31STd gRT SINI b Tr3am |

e | FAEIRT / —
TErId HEdl fgdid 9ol td dRIeRT gusIfian,
gHeTe, e s (fRovo) |

9 IISTold AES 9HEdt fgdig Joft Ud SrRieR] SUSIRIBRI SHeel, a8l ST,
e st (fRow0)

FJhedr H0  NT /2021

S SRR gs A Wi i ]Mer I, FEril @il &1 dle, SIHER INIRT, dgdid
grerTett, Rtenm wirer (fRowo)

ERIE

SATH ST1dT

T —umeia—ua SR gRT 37(2) f2AMES Uw M ORI R dR |

AIfeH 9919 3MH ST |

S SRTRre O A Wi ol e k@, FarRl Giee &7 B, SIPER bR, g
gHemeT, ST @iTer (Bovwo) = 39 3|Teld H ¥UY—ud |fed JheAr qRR fhar g f #a=1 9™
RIoa Rere 78T sices d RFRT qdl g1 RIS &S © Silfd Tad 8 Sdd! -1 M SRRl a5
U3 W &7 R MW 2| T AN B gRT WA SHdT dl AT ARIud qRedl s giad
frar Sirar 2 5 af folt o1 Srier == g3 @i S ]fe M gl dR Bl YaRiST 81 dl
g JAUAT YaxTol BANI MeTad H fa-id 31—01—2022 &I IATId- AT Fdhlaid IO 3B U




ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7015

PR GHAl © AIAT AP YYS—TF SFIERT I= Y W@ 1 IS M B AW B GO
USiipd By ST aR raer uIiRe &R &l SR |

3T fadTd 23—12—2021 BT TR EXER T A 3METed SR SR T 13 |

AER | FARIRT / —
TErIe auEdl fgdid 9ol Ud dRIeR! usIfEian,

gHeITe, e st (fRowo) |

¥ T TES GHTEdl f§dg Aol Ud SRIGR! GUSIRIBNT eHeell, Tl SHeT,
e sl (fRowo)

Hhedr H0  NT /2021

sl Misro Devi w/o Late Sh. Prem Chand, Village Kasba Narwana, P.O. Yol Cant,
Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra.

ERIk|

STH STl

T —umeiaT—ua SR gRT 37(2) f2AEe USw M ORI A I |

AfeH 9919 *MH ST |

si|l Misro Devi w/o Late Sh. Prem Chand, Village Kasba Narwana, P.O. Yol Cant,
Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra = S 3qTeld H IUI—YF HAled JHeAT GRR fHAT & f6 W
afty & AW IoRa Rare AeTal dadr § €M GF A@iell 91 @, Siifd Told & | Sfeal R afd &7
T UM TS OF AElel § 1S9 Aed & gRT TERd ST Bl i THEfd TR s gied
frar mar & 6 afe ol @1 U9 o< g3 #diell &1 §ORil aR Bl QoRISl 8 Al 98 37Ul
TUARTST BRI J7GTed H &I 31—01—2022 BT IFATAAT AT GdhTelad BIOR 3MHI Y TR AHdT ©
3T GATId TULF—TF UH I< GF F@lell & T D ORI Goiidhd fhd S dR 3f<el 9Ika
PR Y SR |

ST fRAId 23—12—2021 BT AR &R T HIER 3rETerd gIRT SIRT T war |

AR | FXRIRT / —
TEId AR fedia o Ud BRIGRT qusIferan,

g, R BiTsT (fRovo) |




7016 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

9 3T 4 GHN HAR, 19 TeNIdaR Ud HeRid FArEdl fgard $1o7, dedia ¢,
St ®iRTsT (fR0 Wo)

P 0 : 29 /NT/2021 TRG SRRT : 11—11—2021 TRRG U9 @ 31—01—2022

M —s BIMR Rig g3 @¥ g, MO @8 o), dion Rg), dedla 9R1, [ it
(fRo wo) et |

3MH STd "QCZI?j‘UI

Ay —eRR 9 goxl 20 Yo Y—RToRa AfRIH, 1954 B &RT 37(3) & 3= |

ureff SWRIGT 7 39 ITaTerd | WAT-UF 7Y AUS—UF 39 AR ¥ U¥ fhar g f6 S9a
w0 fOdr &1 W& AW WH T GF AT & Sidieh el IR, Al I8, & ord Aferd § @
SUAM G SR AT &, S {6 TeAd 2 | 3Fa: HeTdl a1, Al I, & [oRa AfeRd H IdT
A GO AT S |

3T §H TN FANHIRY Pl §9 IS(UF TR d &I 94l & gRT gfaa fear smar 2
& afe fHef & Sqq W o ORI IR DI IoR AT YRSl &1 dl 98 fQAid 31-01—2022 A
T 10.30 91 IATATT AT IHTATT BTN ST ATHR ATAT IoR IT TARTST U PR AhdlT ¢ |
$HD SN By 4 IoR AT TIRIS SN AR 9 BRI QAT 3(AeHh @ Ul & AW ORI &
ey giRd &) & SR |

M feTd 31—12—2021 BT TN SRR T HigY IfRd 3eTad I SNy fhar 17|

e | FXATEIRT / —
WERIS aHTEd! fadrg siofl,

dediel ¥R1, Rt st (fRo 9o) |

In the Court of Shri B. R. Sharma, Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Shimla (R),
District Shimla (H. P.)

Sh. Naresh Kumar Sharma s/o Sh Hari Ram Sharma r/o Village Panihana, P.O. Toon, Sub-
Tehsil Dhami, District Shimla, Himachal Pradesh.

Versus

General Public .. Respondent.

Whereas Sh. Naresh Kumar Sharma s/o Sh Hari Ram Sharma r/o Village Panihana, P.O.
Toon, Sub-Tehsil Dhami, District Shimla, Himachal Pradesh has filed an application alongwith
affidavit in the court of undersigned under section 13(3) of the Birth & Death Registration Act,
1969 to enter the name/date of birth of his daughter named— Miss Neha Sharma d/o Sh. Naresh



ST, feATaet UQel, 27 STHANI, 2022 /7 ATH, 1943 7017

Kumar Sharma r/o Village Panihana, P.O. Toon, Sub-Tehsil Dhami, District Shimla, Himachal
Pradesh in the record of Secy.-cum-Registrar Birth and Death, Gram Panchayat Piplidhar, Sub-
Tehsil Dhami, District Shimla, Himachal Pradesh.

SL. Name of the family member Relation Date of Birth
No.
L. Miss Neha Sharma Daughter 30-01-2000

Hence, this proclamation is issued to the general public if they have any objection/claim
regarding entery of the name/date of birth of above named in the record of Secy.-cum-Registrar
Birth and Death, Gram Panchayat Piplidhar Sub-Tehsil Dhami, District Shimla, Himachal Pradesh,
may file their claims/objections on or before one month of publication of this notice in Govt.
Gazette in this court, failing which necessary orders will be passed.

Issued today 31-12-2021 under my signature and seal of the court.

Seal. Sd/-
Sub-Divisional Magistrate,
Shimla (R), District Shimla (H.P.).

AL

HARTYRT g 3 ST Bl Grerd fbar Sdr & b 3 g & A1 DI W Teld & Sl
RAKSHBIR SINGH TTefd fordl Y off RSt Yigahor #9 A <IrATerd Qrarl =Ieiel do7 e,
ST BT, Civil Suit No. 37/2018, fa9ii 06—03—2018 §RT M &I W7 & RAKSHVEER
SINGH &xar foram © 9fosy & sad 9 gl | A &1 W T RAKSHVEER SINGH 8 gl
q FHSIT WY |

A STy,
73 IR g,
Mg HETed, SThar g-c,

g0 UTeMyR, fotetm wirsT (f20 Yo) |




7018 o193, fRATeeT U9, 27 SIFdR), 2022 /7 ATE, 1943

==, oI M i@ ARl f2ereet uasr, REe—5 gRT gfad o e
Zolagiidh BXIRIRT oTUH, JEISE hitp:/rajpatrahimachal nic.in TR SUEl & YaH fHTS Afid fhar ST Hadr g |



		2022-01-27T15:37:30+0530
	Uma Shankar




