
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

jkti=] fgekpy izns'k 

fgekpy izns'k jkT; 'kklu }kjk izdkf'kr 
ohjokj] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943 

 
fgekpy izns'k ljdkj 

 
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT 

 
NOTIFICATION 

 
Shimla-171 002, the 18th January, 2022 

 
 No. PBW(B&R)(B) F (7)-2/2018.—In continuation  to  this  department  notification of 
even number dated 12th August, 2021, the Governor, Himachal Pradesh is pleased to declare the 
following mentioned road as Major District Road. 
 

198—jkti=@2022&27&01&2022   ¼6995½ 



 6996        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         

Sl. 
No. 

Name of Road District Length 
(Kms) 

MDR 
No's 

109 Bashan to Kalhani Mandi 22.000 118 

110 Banjar-Bahu- Gadagushani-Chhatri-
Magrulla-Janjehli  (via Billagad). 

Kullu/Mandi 81.150 119 

 

 Accordingly the total length of Major District Roads in the State will be 4703.185 kms. 
 

By order, 
Sd/- 

(Subhasish Panda), 
Principal Secretary (PW). 

__________  
 

TRANSPORT DEPARTMENT 
 

NOTIFICATION 
 

Shimla-2, the 24th January, 2022 
 

 No. TPT-C (9)-4/2017-Loose.—The Governor, Himachal Pradesh in exercise of the 
powers conferred by sub-section (6) of Section-41 of the Motor Vehicles Act, 1988 (No. 59 of 
1988) and all other powers enabling him in this behalf is pleased to allot /release registration 
marks/number from Serial No.0001 to 9999 under the Registration marks HP 40F to Registering 
and Licensing Authority, Kangra, District Kangra, Himachal Pradesh for registration of motor 
vehicles with effect from the publication of this notification in the H.P. Rajpatra (Extra Ordinary) 
in the public interest. 

By order, 
 

Jagdish Chander Sharma, IAS, 
Additional Chief Secretary (Transport). 

________ 
 

TRANSPORT DEPARTMENT 
 

NOTIFICATION 
 

Shimla-2, 24th January, 2022 
 

 No. TPT-A(4)-1/2021.—The Governor, Himachal Pradesh on the recommendations of 
Selection Committee, is pleased to appoint Er. Ajay Sharma, Chief General Manager Ropeway and 
Rapid Transport Development Corporation Limited, as Director in Ropeway and Rapid Transport 
System Development Corporation Limited (RTDC), Himachal Pradesh on the usual terms and 
conditions as notified by the Managing Director, Ropeway and Rapid Transport System 
Development Corporation Limited (RTDC) vide Notification No. RTDC/Service Committee/ 
2021/7120 dated 04-10-2021. The appointment shall be effective from the date of taking over the 
charge of Director, Ropeway and Rapid Transport Development Corporation Ltd., Himachal 
Pradesh. 
 

By order, 
 

JAGDISH CHANDER SHARMA, 
Additional Chief Secretary (Transport). 



 

 

6997jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
d`f"k foHkkx 

 
vf/klwpuk 

 
f'keyk&2] 17 tuojh] 2021 

 
 la[;k% ,xz0&ch&,Q¼1½&25@2021-&&lsokvkas ;k izlqfo/kkvksa ;k lgkf;fd;ksa ds ifjnku ds fy, 
vk/kkj dk ,d igpku nLrkost ds :i esa mi;ksx] ljdkj dh ifjnku izfØ;k dks lqxe cukrk gS] 
ikjnf”kZrk vkSj n{krk ykrk gS vkSj ykHkkfFkZ;ksa dks lqfo/kktud vkSj fuckZ/k jhfr esa viuh igpku lkfcr 
djus ds cgqfo/k nLrkost izLrqr djus dh vko”;drk gVkdj] izR;{kr% mUgsa viuh gdnkfj;ka izkIr djus 
gsrq leFkZ cukrk gS( 
 
 d`f’k foHkkx ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~ foHkkx dgk x;k gS½ fdlkuksa dks muds [ksrksa dks taxyh 
tkuojksa ls lajf{kr djus ds fy,] ckM+ yxkus dh O;oLFkk djokdj lgk;rk nsus gsrq i= la[;k 
,xz0&,llh-,p¼,p½6&5@2016 ¼,e,eds,lokbZ½ okWy- III] rkjh[k 31&08&2019 dks tkjh ^^eq[; eU=h 
[ksr laj{k.k ;kstuk^^ ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~ Ldhe dgk x;k gS½] iz”kkflr dj jgk gS] ftls d`f’k 
funs”kky; fgekpy izns”k] f”keyk&5 ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~ dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k dgk x;k gS½ ds 
ek/;e ls dk;kZfUor fd;k tk jgk gS( 
 
 Ldhe ds vUrxZr] fdlkuksa ¼ftUgsa blesa blds i”pkr~ ykHkkFkhZ dgk x;k gS½ dks fofHkUu izdkj dh 
ckM+ tSls dkaVsnkj rkj vkSj pSufyad ckM+ yxkus ds fy, 50 izfr”kr] lkSj pkfyr ckM+ ¼O;fDrxr½ yxkus 
ds fy, 80 izfr”kr ¼lkeqnkf;d½ 85 izfr”kr vkSj daiksftV ckM+ yxkus ds fy, 70 izfr”kr dh foÙkh; 
lgk;rk ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~ izlqfo/kk dgk x;k gS½ fo|eku Ldhe ds ekxZn”kZd fl)kUrksa ds vuqlkj 
dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k }kjk iznku dh tkrh gS( 
 
 iwoksZDr Ldhe esa fgekpy izns”k jkT; dh lafpr fuf/k eas ls mixr fd;k tkus okyk vkorhZ O;; 
vUroZfyr gS( 
 
 vr% fgekpy izns”k ds jkT;iky] vk/kkj ¼foÙkh; vkSj vU; lgkf;fd;ksa] izlqfo/kkvksa vkSj lsokvksa dk 
yf{;r ifjnku½ vf/kfu;e] 2016 ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~ mDr vf/kfu;e dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 7 }kjk 
inÙk “kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,] fuEufyf[kr vf/klwfpr djrs gSa] vFkkZr~%& 
 

 1- ¼1½ Ldhe ds vUrxZr izlqfo/kk,a izkIr djus ds fy, ik= fdlh O;f’V dks ,rn~}kjk vk/kkj 
la[;k /kkj.k djus dk lcwr izLrqr djuk gksxk ;k vk/kkj vf/kizek.ku izkIr djuk gksxkA 
 

 ¼2½ Ldhe ds vUrxZr izlqfo/kk,a izkIr djus dh okaNk j[kus okyk dksbZ O;f’V] ftlds ikl vk/kkj 
la[;k ugha gS ;k tks vHkh rd vk/kkj ds fy, ukekafdr ugha gS] dks Ldhe ds fy, jftLVªhdj.k ls iwoZ 
vk/kkj ds ukekadu ds fy, vkosnu djuk visf{kr gksxk ;fn og mDr vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3 ds vuqlkj 
vk/kkj vfHkizkIr djus ds fy, gdnkj gS vkSj ,sls O;f’V vk/kkj dk vH;kos”ku djokus ds fy, fdlh vk/kkj 
vH;kos”ku dsUnz ¼lwph Hkkjrh; fof”k’V igpku izkf/kdj.k ¼;w0vkbZ0Mh0,0vkbZ0½ oSclkbV www.uidai.gov. 
in ij miyC/k gS½ ij tk,axs% 
 

 ¼3½ vk/kkj ¼ukekadu vkSj v|ru½ fofu;e] 2016 ds fofu;e 12 ds vuqlkj] foHkkx dks vius 
dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls mu ykHkkfFkZ;ksa ds fy, vk/kkj ukekadu lqfo/kk,a iznku djus dh 
vko”;drk gS tks vHkh rd vk/kkj ds fy, ukekafdr ugha gS vkSj ;fn lacaf/kr [k.M ;k rglhy esa dksbZ 
vk/kkj ukekadu dsUnz vofLFkr ugha gS] rks foHkkx vius dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls ;wvkbZMh,vkbZ ds 
fo|eku jftLVªkj ds leUo; ls lqfo/kktud LFkkuksa ij ;k Lo;a gh ;wvkbZMh,vkbZ jftLVªkj dh gSfl;r ls 
vk/kkj ukekadu lqfo/kk,a iznku djsxk% 
 

 ijUrq tc rd dh O;f’V dks vk/kkj leuqnsf”kr ugha fd;k tkrk gS] rc rd ,sls O;f’V dks 
fuEufyf[kr nLrkost izLrqr djus ds v/;/khu Ldhe ds v/khu izlqfo/kk iznku dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~~%& 



 6998        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 ¼d½ ;fn og mldhs vk/kkj vH;kos”ku igpku iphZ ds lkFk vH;kosf”kr fd;k x;k gS] rks mldh 
vk/kkj vH;kos”ku igpku iphZ( vkSj 
 
 ¼[k½ fuEufyf[kr esa ls dksbZ nLrkost gS] vFkkZr~~%& 
 
  ¼i½ QksVks lfgr cSad ;k iksLV vkWfQl iklcqd( ;k 
 

  ¼ii½ LFkk;h [kkrk la[;k ¼ih0,0,u0½ dkMZ( ;k 
 

  ¼iii½ ikliksVZ( ;k 
 

  ¼iv½ jk”ku dkMZ( ;k 
  ¼v½ ernkrk igpku i=( ;k 
 
  ¼vi½ eujsxk dkMZ( ;k 
 
  ¼vii½ fdlku QksVks iklcqd( ;k 
 
  ¼viii½ eksVj ;ku vf/kfu;e]1988 ¼1988 dk 59½ ds v/khu vuqKkiu izkf/kdkjh }kjk tkjh 

pkyu vuqKfIr( ;k 
 
  ¼ix½ jktif=r vf/kdkjh ;k rglhynkj }kjk “kkldh; “kh’kZukek ij tkjh ,sls O;fDr ds 

QksVks dh igpku okyk izek.k i=( ;k 
 
  ¼x½ foHkkx }kjk ;FkkfofufnZ’V dksbZ vU; nLrkost% 
 
 ijUrq ;g fd mijksDr nLrkostksa dh tkap foHkkx }kjk ml iz;kstu ds fy, fofufnZ’V :i ls 
ukefufnZ’V fdlh vf/kdkjh }kjk dh tk,xhA 
 

 2- Ldhe ds vUrxZr lqfo/kkiwoZd ykHkkfFkZ;ksa dks izlqfo/kk,a miyC/k djokus ds vk”k; ls foHkkx 
vius dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls ;g lqfuf”pr djus ds fy, leLr visf{kr O;oLFkk,a djsxk fd 
mDr ykHkkfFkZ;ksa dks vis{kkvksa ds lEca/k esa] mUgsa tkx:d djus ds fy,] ykHkkfFkZ;ksa gsrq ehfM;k ds ek/;e 
ls] O;kid izpkj fd;k tk,xkA 
 

 3- mu leLr ekeyksa esa tgka ykHkkfFkZ;ksa ds vLi’V ¼vid`’V½ ck;ksseSfVªd ds dkj.k ;k fdlh 
vU; dkj.k ls] vk/kkj izek.ku vlQy jgrk gS] ogka fuEufyf[kr mipkjkRed fØ;kfof/k vaxhd``r dh 
tk,xh] vFkkZr~~%& 
 
 ¼d½ vLi’V maxyh Nki DokfyVh dh n”kk esa] vf/kizek.ku gsrq vka[k dh iqryh ds LdSu ;k psgjk 
vf/kizek.ku lqfo/kk vaxhd`r dh tk,xh] rn~}kjk foHkkx vius dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls izek.ku ds 
fy, fuckZ/k jhfr esa izlqfo/kkvksa ds ifjnku gsrq maxyh&Nki vf/kizek.ku lfgr vka[k dh iqryh ds LdSu ;k 
psgjk vf/kizek.ku ds fy, O;oLFkk,a djsxk( 
 
 ¼[k½ maxyh Nki ;k vka[k dh iqryh dk LdSu ;k psgjk vf/kizek.ku ds ek/;e ls ck;kseSfVªd 
vf/kizek.ku dh vlQyrk dh n”kk esa] tgka dgha Hkh lk/; vkSj xzkg~; gS] ogka vf/kizek.ku lhfer le; 
oS/krk lfgr] ;FkkfLFkfr] ,d eq”r vk/kkj ikloMZ ;k le;k/kkfjr ,d eq”r ikloMZ }kjk iznku fd;k 
tk,xk( 
 
 ¼x½ mu leLr vU; ekeyksa esa] tgka ck;kseSfVªd ;k ,d eq”r vk/kkj ikloMZ ;k le; vk/kkfjr 
,d eq”r ikloMZ vf/kizek.ku lEHko ugha gS] ogka Ldhe ds vUrxZr izlqfo/kk,a oLrqxr vk/kkj o.kZ ¼v{kj½ ds 
vk/kkj ij nh tk ldsxh] ftudh vf/kizekf.kdrk vk/kkj ij eqfnzr rqjUr izR;qRrj ¼D;w-vkj-½ dksM ds ek/;e 



 

 

6999jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
ls lR;kfir dh tk,xh vkSj rqjUr izR;qRrj ¼D;w-vkj-½ dksM dk vFkZ yxkus ¼i<+us ds fy,½ ds fy, foHkkx 
}kjk blds dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls lqfo/kktud LFkkuksa  ij vko';d O;oLFkk dh tk,xhA 
 
 

 4- mijksDr ds vfrfjDr ;g lqfuf”pr djus ds vk”k; ls] fd dksbZ okLrfod ykHkkFkhZ Ldhe ds 
vUrxZr mudks ns; izlqfo/kkvksa ls oafpr u gks] foHkkx vius dk;kZU;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls Mh0ch0Vh0 
fe”ku] dSfcusV lSØsVsfj,V] Hkkjr ljdkj ds dk;kZy; Kkiu rkjh[k 19 fnlEcj] 2017 esa ;Fkk lkjkaf”kr 
viokn dk fuiVku djus ds fy, fØ;kfof/k dk vuqlj.k djsxkA 
 

 5- ;g vf/klwpuk jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½] fgekpy izns”k esa blds izdk”ku dh rkjh[k ls izo``Rr gksxhA 
 

vkns”k }kjk] 
 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
lfpo ¼d`f’k½A 

 
&&&&&&&&&  

 
 [Authoritative English text of this Department Notification No. Agr-B-F(1)-25/2021, dated         
17-01-2022 as required under Article 348 (3) of Constitution of India]. 

 
AGRICULTURE DEPARTMENT 

 
NOTIFICATION 

 
Shimla-2, the 17th  January, 2022 

 
 No. Agr-B-F(1)-25/2021.—Whereas, the use of Aadhaar as an identity document for 
delivery of services  or benefits or subsidies simplifies the Government delivery processes, brings 
in transparency and efficiency, and enables beneficiaries to get their entitlements directly in a 
convenient and seamless manner by obviating the need to produce multiple documents to prove  
one’s identity; 
 
 And whereas, the Department of Agriculture (hereinafter referred to as  the Department), is 
administering the “Mukhya Mantri Khet Sanrakshan Yojna” (hereinafter referred to as the Scheme) 
issued vide letter No. Agr.SC.H(H)6-35/2016(MMKSY)-Vol.-III, dated 31-08-2019 to help the 
farmers by providing the fencing in their fields to protect from wild animals which is being 
implemented through the Directorate of Agriculture, Himachal Pradesh, Shimla-5 (hereinafter 
referred to as the Implementing Agency); 
 

 And whereas, under the Scheme, financial assistance in different types of fencing provided 
as 50% in Barbed and  Interlink  chain,  80%  in  Solar  Fencing  (Individual), 85% (Community) 
and 70% Composite Fencing (hereinafter referred to as the benefit) is given to the agricultural 
farmers (hereinafter referred to as the beneficiaries), by the Implementing Agency as per the extant 
Scheme guidelines; 
 

 And whereas, the aforesaid Scheme involves recurring expenditure incurred from the 
Consolidated Fund of Himachal Pradesh; 
 

 Now, therefore, in exercise of powers conferred by section 7 of the Aadhaar (Targeted 
Delivery of Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016, the Governor, 
Himachal Pradesh is pleased to notify following, namely:— 
 

 1. (1) An individual eligible for receiving the benefits under the Scheme shall hereby be 
required to furnish proof of possession of the Aadhaar number or undergo Aadhaar authentication. 



 7000        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 (2) Any individual desirous of availing benefits  under the Scheme, who does not possess 
the Aadhaar number or, has not yet enrolled for Aadhaar, shall be required to make application for 
Aadhaar enrolment before registering for the Scheme provided that he is entitled to obtain Aadhaar 
as per section 3 of the said Act, and such individuals shall visit any Aadhaar enrolment centre [list 
available at the Unique Identification Authority of India (UIDAI) website www.uidai.gov.in]  to get 
enrolled for Aadhaar. 

 
 (3) As per regulation 12 of the Aadhaar (Enrolment and Update) Regulations, 2016, the 
Department through its Implementing Agency, is required to offer Aadhaar enrolment facilities for 
the beneficiaries who are not yet enrolled for Aadhaar and in case there is no Aadhaar enrolment 
centre located in the respective Block or Tehsil, the Department through its Implementing Agency 
shall provide Aadhaar enrolment facilities at convenient locations in co-ordination with the existing 
Registrars of UIDAI or by becoming a UIDAI Registrar themselves: 
 
 Provided that till the time Aadhaar is assigned to the individual, benefits under the Scheme 
shall be given to such individual, subject to the production of the following documents, namely :– 
 
 (a) if he has enrolled, his Aadhaar Enrolment Identification slip; and 
 
 (b) any one of the following documents, namely:— 
 
  (i) Bank or Post Office Passbook with Photo; or 
 
  (ii) Permanent Account Number (PAN) Card; or 
 
  (iii) Passport; or 
 
  (iv) Ration Card; or 
 
  (v) Voter Identity Card; or 
 
  (vi) MGNREGA card; or 
 
  (vii) Kisan Photo passbook; or 
 
  (viii)Driving license issued by the Licensing Authority under the Motor Vehicles Act, 

1988 (59 of 1988); or 
 
  (ix) Certificate of identity having photo of such person issued by a Gazetted Officer or 

a Tehsildar on an official letter head; or 

 
  (x) any other document as specified by the Department: 

 
 Provided  further  that  the  above  documents  may  be  checked  by  an  officer specifically 
designated by the Department for that purpose. 

 
 2. In order to provide benefits to the beneficiaries under the Scheme conveniently, the 
Department through its Implementing Agency shall make all the required arrangements to ensure 
that wide publicity through the media shall be given to the beneficiaries to make them aware of the 
said requirement. 



 

 

7001jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 3. In all cases, where Aadhaar authentication fails due to poor biometrics of the 
beneficiaries or due to any other reason, the following remedial mechanisms shall be adopted, 
namely:— 
 
 (a) in case of poor fingerprint quality, iris scan or face authentication facility shall be 
adopted for authentication, thereby the Department through its Implementing Agency shall make 
provisions for iris scanners or face authentication along with finger-print authentication for delivery 
of benefits in seamless manner; 
 

 (b) in case the biometric authentication through fingerprints or iris scan or face 
authentication is not successful, wherever feasible and admissible authentication by Aadhaar One 
Time Password or Time-based One-Time Password with limited time validity, as the case may be, 
shall be offered; 
 

 (c) in all other cases where biometric or Aadhaar One Time Password or Time-based One-
Time Password authentication is not possible, benefits under the Scheme may be given on the basis 
of physical Aadhaar letter whose authenticity can be verified through the Quick Response code 
printed on the Aadhaar letter and the necessary arrangement of Quick Response code reader shall 
be provided at the convenient locations by the Department  through its Implementing Agency. 
 
 4. In addition to the above, in order to ensure that no bonafide beneficiary under the 
Scheme is deprived of his due benefits, the Department through its Implementing Agency shall 
follow the exception handling mechanism as outlined in the Office Memorandum of DBT Mission, 
Cabinet Secretariat, Government of India dated 19th December 2017. 
 
 5. This notification shall come into effect from the date of its publication in the Rajpatra 
(e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh. 
 

By order, 
 

Sd/- 
Secretary (Agr.). 

 
____________ 

 
 

d`f"k foHkkx 
 

vf/klwpuk 
 

f'keyk&2] 17 tuojh] 2021 
 
 la[;k% ,xz0&ch&,Q¼1½&27@2021-&&lsokvkas ;k izlqfo/kkvksa ;k lgkf;fd;ksa ds ifjnku ds fy, 
vk/kkj dk ,d igpku nLrkost ds :i esa mi;ksx] ljdkj dh ifjnku izfØ;k dks lqxe cukrk gS] 
ikjnf”kZrk vkSj n{krk ykrk gS vkSj ykHkkfFkZ;ksa dks lqfo/kktud vkSj fuckZ/k jhfr esa viuh igpku lkfcr 
djus ds cgqfo/k nLrkost izLrqr djus dh vko”;drk gVkdj] izR;{kr% mUgsa viuh gdnkfj;ka izkIr djus 
gsrq leFkZ cukrk gS( 
 
 d`f’k foHkkx ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~~ foHkkx dgk x;k gS½ flapkbZ ds iz;kstu ds fy, mBkÅ ty 
ds 2500 lkSj iEi miyC/k djokdj fdlkuksa dh lgk;rk gsrq *lkSj flapkbZ ;kstuk* ¼ftls blesa blds 
i”pkr~ Ldhe dgk x;k gS½ iz”kkflr dj jgk gS] ftls d`f’k funs”kky;] fgekpy izns”k ¼ftls blesa blds 
i”pkr~~ dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k dgk x;k gS½ ds ek/;e ls dk;kZfUor fd;k tk jgk gS( 



 7002        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 Ldhe ds vUrxZr d`f’k Hkwfe okys fdlkuksa ¼ftUgsa blesa blds i”pkr~ ykHkkFkhZ dgk x;k gS½] y?kq 
vkSj lhekar fdlkuksa dks 85 izfr”kr vkSj e/;e vkSj cM+s fdlkuksa dks 80 izfr”kr dh foÙkh; lgk;rk] ¼ftls 
blesa blds i”pkr~~ izlqfo/kk dgk x;k gS½ fo|eku Ldhe ds ekxZn”kZd fl)kUrksa ds vuqlkj dk;kZUo;u 
vfHkdj.k }kjk iznku dh tkrh gS( 
 
 iwoksZDr Ldhe esa fgekpy izns”k jkT; dh lafpr fuf/k eas ls mixr fd;k tkus okyk vkorhZ O;; 
vUroZfyr gS( 
 
 vr% fgekpy izns”k ds jkT;iky] vk/kkj ¼foÙkh; vkSj vU; lgkf;fd;ksa] izlqfo/kkvksa vkSj lsokvksa dk 
yf{;r ifjnku½ vf/kfu;e] 2016 ¼ftls blesa blds i”pkr~ mDr vf/kfu;e dgk x;k gS½ dh /kkjk 7 }kjk 
iznÙk “kfDr;ksa dk iz;ksx djrs gq,] fuEufyf[kr vf/klwfpr djrs gSa] vFkkZr~%& 
 
 1 ¼1½ Ldhe ds vUrxZr izlqfo/kk,a izkIr djus ds fy, ik= dksbZ O;f’V dks ,rn~}kjk vk/kkj 
la[;k /kkj.k djus dk lcwr izLrqr djuk gksxk ;k vk/kkj vf/kizek.ku izkIr djuk gksxkA 
 
 ¼2½ Ldhe ds vUrxZr izlqfo/kk,a izkIr djus dh okaNk j[kus okyk dksbZ O;f’V] ftlds ikl vk/kkj 
la[;k ugha gS ;k tks vHkh rd vk/kkj ds fy, ukekafdr ugha gS] dks Ldhe ds fy, jftLVªhdj.k ls iwoZ 
vk/kkj ds ukekadu ds fy, vkosnu djuk visf{kr gksxk ;fn og mDr vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 3 ds vuqlkj 
vk/kkj vfHkizkIr djus ds fy, gdnkj gS vkSj ,sls O;f’V vk/kkj dk vH;kos”ku djokus ds fy, fdlh vk/kkj 
vH;kos”ku dsUnz [lwph Hkkjrh; fof”k’V igpku izkf/kdj.k ¼;w0 vkbZ0 Mh0 ,0 vkbZ0½ oSclkbV 
www.uidai.gov. in ij miyC/k gS] ij tk,axs% 
 
 ¼3½ vk/kkj ¼ukekadu vkSj v|ru½ fofu;e] 2016 ds fofu;e 12 ds vuqlkj] foHkkx dks vius 
dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls mu ykHkkfFkZ;ksa ds fy, vk/kkj ukekadu lqfo/kk,a iznku djus dh 
vko”;drk gS tks vHkh rd vk/kkj ds fy, ukekafdr ugha gS vkSj ;fn lacaf/kr [k.M ;k rglhy esa dksbZ 
vk/kkj ukekadu dsUnz vofLFkr ugha gS] rks foHkkx vius dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls ;wvkbZMh,vkbZ ds 
fo|eku jftLVªkj ds leUo; ls lqfo/kktud LFkkuksa ij ;k Lo;a gh ;wvkbZMh,vkbZ jftLVªkj dh gSfl;r ls 
vk/kkj ukekadu lqfo/kk,a iznku djsxk% 
 
 ijUrq tc rd dh O;f’V dks vk/kkj leuqnsf”kr ugha fd;k tkrk gS] rc rd ,sls O;f’V dks 
fuEufyf[kr nLrkost izLrqr djus ds v/;/khu Ldhe ds v/khu izlqfo/kk iznku dh tk,xh] vFkkZr~~%& 
 
 ¼d½ ;fn og mldhs vk/kkj vH;kos”ku igpku iphZ ds lkFk vH;kosf”kr fd;k x;k gS rks mldh 
vk/kkj vH;kos”ku igpku iphZ( vkSj 
 
 ¼[k½ fuEufyf[kr esa ls dksbZ nLrkost gS] vFkkZr~~%& 
 
  ¼i½ QksVks lfgr cSad ;k iksLV vkWfQl iklcqd( ;k 
 
  ¼ii½ LFkk;h [kkrk la[;k ¼ih0,0,u0½ dkMZ( ;k 
 
  ¼iii½ ikliksVZ( ;k 
 

  ¼iv½ jk”ku dkMZ( ;k 
 

  ¼v½ ernkrk igpku i=( ;k 
 

  ¼vi½ eujsxk dkMZ( ;k 
 

  ¼vii½ fdlku QksVks iklcqd( ;k 



 

 

7003jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
  ¼viii½ eksVj ;ku vf/kfu;e] 1988 ¼1988 dk 59½ ds v/khu vuqKkiu izkf/kdkjh }kjk tkjh 

pkyu vuqKfIr( ;k 
 
  ¼ix½ jktif=r vf/kdkjh ;k rglhynkj }kjk “kkldh; “kh’kZukek ij tkjh ,sls O;fDr ds QksVks 

dh igpku okyk izek.k i=( ;k 
 
  ¼x½ foHkkx }kjk ;FkkfofufnZ’V dksbZ vU; nLrkost% 
 
 ijUrq ;g fd mijksDr nLrkostksa dh tkap foHkkx }kjk ml iz;kstu ds fy, fofufnZ’V :i ls 
ukefufnZ’V fdlh vf/kdkjh }kjk dh tk,xhA 
 
 2- Ldhe ds vUrxZr lqfo/kkiwoZd ykHkkfFkZ;ksa dks izlqfo/kk,a miyC/k djokus ds vk”k; ls foHkkx vius 
dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls ;g lqfuf”pr djus ds fy, leLr visf{kr O;oLFkk,a djsxk fd mDr 
ykHkkfFkZ;ksa dks vis{kkvksa ds lEca/k esa] mUgsa tkx:d djus ds fy,] ykHkkfFkZ;ksa gsrq ehfM;k ds ek/;e ls] 
O;kid izpkj fd;k tk,xkA 
 
 3- mu leLr ekeyksa esa tgka ykHkkfFkZ;ksa ds vLi’V ¼vid`’V½ ck;ksseSfVªd ds dkj.k ;k fdlh vU; 
dkj.k ls] vk/kkj izek.ku vlQy jgrk gS] ogka fuEufyf[kr mipkjkRed fØ;kfof/k vaxhd``r dh tk,xh] 
vFkkZr~~%& 
 
 ¼d½ vLi’V maxyh Nki DokfyVh dh n”kk esa] vf/kizek.ku gsrq vka[k dh iqryh ds LdSu ;k psgjk 
vf/kizek.ku lqfo/kk vaxhd`r dh tk,xh] rn~}kjk foHkkx vius dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls izek.ku ds 
fy, fuckZ/k jhfr esa izlqfo/kkvksa ds ifjnku gsrq maxyh&Nki vf/kizek.ku lfgr vka[k dh iqryh ds LdSu ;k 
psgjk vf/kizek.ku ds fy, O;oLFkk,a djsxk( 
 
 ¼[k½ maxyh Nki ;k vka[k dh iqryh dk LdSu ;k psgjk vf/kizek.ku ds ek/;e ls ck;kseSfVªd 
vf/kizek.ku dh vlQyrk dh n”kk esa] tgka dgha Hkh lk/; vkSj xzkg~; gS] ogka vf/kizek.ku lhfer le; 
oS/krk lfgr] ;FkkfLFkfr] ,d eq”r vk/kkj ikloMZ ;k le;k/kkfjr ,d eq”r ikloMZ }kjk iznku fd;k 
tk,xk( 
 
 ¼x½ mu leLr vU; ekeyksa esa] tgka ck;kseSfVªd ;k ,d eq”r vk/kkj ikloMZ ;k le; vk/kkfjr 
,d eq”r ikloMZ vf/kizek.ku lEHko ugha gS] ogka Ldhe ds vUrxZr izlqfo/kk,a oLrqxr vk/kkj o.kZ ¼v{kj½ ds 
vk/kkj ij nh tk ldsxh] ftudh vf/kizekf.kdrk vk/kkj ij eqfnzr rqjUr izR;qRrj ¼D;w-vkj-½ dksM ds ek/;e 
ls lR;kfir dh tk,xh vkSj rqjUr izR;qRrj ¼D;w-vkj-½ dksM dk vFkZ yxkus ¼i<+us ds fy,½ ds fy, foHkkx 
}kjk blds dk;kZUo;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls lqfo/kktud LFkkuksa ij vko';d O;oLFkk dh tk,xhA 
 
 4- mijksDr ds vfrfjDr ;g lqfuf”pr djus ds vk”k; ls] fd dksbZ okLrfod ykHkkFkhZ Ldhe ds 
vUrxZr mudks ns; izlqfo/kkvksa ls oafpr u gks] foHkkx vius dk;kZU;u vfHkdj.k ds ek/;e ls Mh0ch0Vh0 
fe”ku] dSfcusV lSØsVsfj,V] Hkkjr ljdkj ds dk;kZy; Kkiu rkjh[k 19 fnlEcj] 2017 esa ;Fkk lkjkaf”kr 
viokn dk fuiVku djus ds fy, fØ;kfof/k dk vuqlj.k djsxkA 
 
 5- ;g vf/klwpuk jkti= ¼bZ&xtV½] fgekpy izns”k esa blds izdk”ku dh rkjh[k ls izo``Rr gksxhA 
 
 

vkns”k }kjk] 
 

gLrk{kfjr@& 
lfpo ¼d`f’k½A 



 7004        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 [Authoritative English text of this Department Notification No. Agr-B-F(1)-27/2021, dated          
17-01-2022 as required under Article 348 (3) of Constitution of India]. 

 

AGRICULTURE DEPARTMENT 
 

NOTIFICATION 
 

Shimla-2, the 17th  January, 2022 
 

 No. Agr-B-F(1)-27/2021.—Whereas, the use of Aadhaar as an identity document for 
delivery of services or benefits or subsidies simplifies the Government delivery processes, brings in 
transparency and efficiency, and enables beneficiaries to get their entitlements directly in a 
convenient and seamless manner by obviating the need to produce multiple documents to prove  
one’s identity; 
 
 And whereas, the Department of Agriculture (hereinafter referred to as  the Department), is 
administering the “Saur Sinchayee Yojna” (hereinafter referred to as the Scheme) to help the 
farmers by providing solar pumps to lift the water for irrigation purpose which is being 
implemented through the Directorate of Agriculture, Himachal Pradesh, Shimla-5 (hereinafter 
referred to as the Implementing Agency); 
 
 And whereas, under the Scheme, financial assistance is provided as 85% for Small and 
Marginal farmers and 80% for Medium and Big farmers (hereinafter referred to as the benefit) is 
given to the farmers having agricultural land (hereinafter referred to as the beneficiaries), by the 
Implementing Agency as per the extant Scheme guidelines; 
 
 And whereas, the aforesaid Scheme involves recurring expenditure incurred from the 
Consolidated Fund of Himachal Pradesh; 
 
 Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by section 7 of the Aadhaar (Targeted 
Delivery of Financial and Other Subsidies, Benefits and Services) Act, 2016 (18 of 2016) 
(hereinafter referred to as the said Act), the Governor, Himachal Pradesh is pleased to notify 
following, namely:— 
 
 1. (1) An individual eligible for receiving the benefits under the Scheme shall hereby be 
required to furnish proof of possession of the Aadhaar number or undergo Aadhaar authentication. 
 
 (2) Any individual desirous of availing benefits  under the Scheme, who does not possess 
the Aadhaar number or, has not yet enrolled for Aadhaar, shall be required to make application for 
Aadhaar enrolment before registering for the Scheme provided that he is entitled to obtain Aadhaar 
as per section 3 of the said Act, and such individuals shall visit any Aadhaar enrolment centre [list 
available at the Unique Identification Authority of India (UIDAI) website www.uidai.gov.in]  to get 
enrolled for Aadhaar. 
 
 (3) As per regulation 12 of the Aadhaar (Enrolment and Update) Regulations, 2016, the 
Department through its Implementing Agency, is required to offer Aadhaar enrolment facilities for 
the beneficiaries who are not yet enrolled for Aadhaar and in case there is no Aadhaar enrolment 
centre located in the respective Block or Taluka or Tehsil, the Department through its 
Implementing Agency shall provide Aadhaar enrolment facilities at convenient locations in co-
ordination with the existing Registrars of UIDAI or by becoming a UIDAI Registrar themselves: 
 
 Provided that till the time Aadhaar is assigned to the individual, benefits under the Scheme 
shall be given to such individual, subject to the production of the following documents, namely:— 



 

 

7005jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 (a) if he has enrolled, his Aadhaar Enrolment Identification slip; and 
 
 (b) any one of the following documents, namely:— 
 
  (i) Bank or Post Office Passbook with Photo; or 
 
  (ii) Permanent Account Number (PAN) Card; or 
 
  (iii) Passport; or 
 
  (iv) Ration Card; or 
 
  (v) Voter Identity Card; or 
  (vi) MGNREGA card; or 
 
  (vii) Kisan Photo passbook; or 
 
  (viii)Driving license issued by the Licensing Authority under the Motor Vehicles Act, 

1988 (59 of 1988); or 
 
  (ix) Certificate of identity having photo of such person issued by a Gazetted Officer or 

a Tehsildar on an official letter head; or 
 
  (x) any other document as specified by the Department: 
 
 Provided  further  that  the  above  documents  may  be  checked  by  an  officer specifically 
designated by the Department for that purpose. 
 
 2. In order to provide benefits to the beneficiaries under the Scheme conveniently, the 
Department through its Implementing Agency shall make all the required arrangements to ensure 
that wide publicity through the media shall be given to the beneficiaries to make them aware of the 
said requirement. 
 
 3. In all cases, where Aadhaar authentication fails due to poor biometrics of the 
beneficiaries or due to any other reason, the following remedial mechanisms shall be adopted, 
namely:— 
 
 (a) in case of poor fingerprint quality, iris scan or face authentication facility shall be 
adopted for authentication, thereby the Department through its Implementing Agency shall make 
provisions for iris scanners or face authentication along with finger-print authentication for delivery 
of benefits in seamless manner; 
 
 (b) in case the biometric authentication through fingerprints or iris scan or face 
authentication is not successful, wherever feasible and admissible authentication by Aadhaar One 
Time Password or Time-based One-Time Password with limited time validity, as the case may be, 
shall be offered; 
 
 (c) in all other cases where biometric or Aadhaar One Time Password or Time-based One-
Time Password authentication is not possible,  benefits under the Scheme may be given on the 
basis of physical Aadhaar letter whose authenticity can be verified through the Quick Response 
code printed on the Aadhaar letter and the necessary arrangement of Quick Response code reader 
shall be provided at the convenient locations by the Department  through its Implementing Agency. 



 7006        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 4. In addition to the above, in order to ensure that no bona fide beneficiary under the 
Scheme is deprived of his due benefits, the Department through its Implementing Agency shall 
follow the exception handling mechanism as outlined in the Office Memorandum of DBT Mission, 
Cabinet Secretariat, Government of India dated 19th December, 2017. 
 
 5. This notification shall come into effect from the date of its publication in the Rajpatra 
(e-Gazette), Himachal Pradesh. 
 

By order, 
 

Sd/- 
Secretary (Agr.). 

 
_________  

 
HIMACHAL PRADESH ELECTRICITY REGULATORY COMMISSION, SHIMLA 

 
NOTIFICATION 

 
Shimla, the 20th January, 2022 

 
 HPERC-(H)(1)-1/2012.—The Himachal Pradesh Electricity Regulatory Commission in 
exercise of the powers conferred under Clauses (r) and (s) of sub-section (2) of Section 181, read 
with sub-sections (5) to (8) of Section 42, of the Electricity Act, 2003 (36 of 2003) and all other 
powers enabling it in this behalf, after previous publication, hereby makes the following 
amendment in the Himachal Pradesh Electricity Regulatory Commission (Consumer Grievances 
Redressal Forum and Ombudsman) Regulations, 2013, namely:— 
 

REGULATIONS 
 

 1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These Regulations may be called the Himachal 
Pradesh Electricity Regulatory Commission (Consumer Grievances Redressal Forum and 
Ombudsman) (Second Amendment) Regulations, 2022. 
 
 (2)  These Regulations shall come into force from the date of their publication in the 
Rajpatra, Himachal Pradesh. 
 
  2. Amendment of Regulation 3.—In Regulation 3 of the said Regulations.—In Sub-
regulation (1), for item (f), the following shall be substituted, namely:— 
 
 “(f) “Forum” means a Forum, established or to be established, by the distribution licensee 

under sub-section (5) of Section 42 of the Act, as per the guidelines contained in these 
Regulations;” 

 
  3. Amendment of Regulation 5.—In Regulation 5 of the said Regulations.—(i) in  
Sub-regulation  (1),  for  the  sign  “:”,  the  sign  “.”  shall  be substituted and the proviso thereto 
shall be omitted; and 
 
 (ii) for Sub-regulation (2), the following shall be substituted, namely :- “(2) The  
distribution licensee may, after considering various related factors such as the number of consumers 
under different categories of retail tariff, number of representations generally received and disposed 
of, ease of access for the consumers in the various areas, establish by order, under intimation to the 



 

 

7007jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
Commission, additional Forum in its area of supply and in that event each Forum shall have the 
jurisdiction, linked to any one or more relevant parameters such as geographical/operational areas, 
the tariff related categories of consumers etc., as the distribution licensee may, by order, define 
from time to time: 
 
Provided that  in  addition  to the  Forum established as per Sub-regulation (1), the distribution 
licensee, shall, latest by 30th April, 2022, also establish under intimation to the Commission, at 
least one additional Forum for each of its operation circles and the jurisdiction thereof in relation to 
the consumers under the respective operation circles, shall be as follows, namely :— 
 
 (i) in case of the consumers covered under single part retail tariff- all types of complaints, 

whether monetary or non- monetary ; and 
 
 (ii) in case of the consumers covered under two part retail tariff – all types of complaints 

whether monetary or non monetary, where the following conditions are met – 
 
  (a) the amount of dispute / claim does not exceed two lakh in each case; and 
 
  (b) the standard supply voltage does not exceed 22kV: 
 
   Provided further that in the event of establishing additional Forums at 

Divisional/Sub- divisional level, the distribution licensee shall also modify, under 
intimation to the Commission, the territorial jurisdiction of the Forum established 
at the head quarter of that Circle. 

 
 (3) The Commission may, duly taking into account the factors mentioned in Sub-
regulation (1), direct, from time to time, the distribution licensee to establish, under intimation to 
the Commission, the additional Forums at various locations and also to define/modify the 
jurisdiction of each Forum established, or to be established, under the provisions of these 
Regulations. 
 
 (4) The complaints not falling under the jurisdiction of the additional Forums, established 
as per Sub-regulation (2) and sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, shall continue to fall under the 
jurisdiction of Forum established under Sub- regulation (1) of Regulation 5. 
 
  4. Amendment of Regulation 6.—For  Regulation 6  of  the  said Regulations, the 
following shall be substituted, namely:— 
 
 “6. Headquarters of Forum.—The head quarter of the Forum, established as per Sub-

regulation (1) of Regulation 5, shall preferably be at the head quarter of the distribution 
licensee. The head quarter for additional Forums established as per the first proviso to the 
sub-regulation (2) of Regulation 5, shall be at the headquarters of the respective operation 
circles. The head quarters of the other Forums, if any, established as per sub-regulation (2) 
and Sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, shall be fixed by the distribution licensee. Each 
Forum may, with the overall objective of ensuring that the complaints/grievances are heard 
and redressed within the time limit specified under these Regulations, conduct its sittings 
preferably in the areas, within its territorial jurisdiction, having industrial belts, as it may 
consider appropriate.” 

 
 5. Amendment of Regulation7.—In Regulation 7 of the said Regulations.— 
 
  (I) In sub-regulation (1) – 



 7008        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
   (i) for the sign “;” appearing in sub-clause (b) of clause (i), the sign “:” shall be 

substituted and thereafter the following provisos shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
    “Provided that in case of additional Forum established, or to be established, 

as per Sub-regulation (2) and Sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, the 
distribution licensee shall designate, on Ex-officio basis, the Members of 
each such Forum out of its serving officers having appropriate qualifications, 
who shall perform their functions in the said Forums in addition to their 
normal assigned duties and out of such designated Members, one Member 
shall be designated as Chairperson of that Forum: 

 
    Provided further that no officer of a rank of less than Superintending 

Engineer shall be designated as Member-cum-Chairperson of any additional 
Forum to be established as per first proviso to Sub-regulation (2) of 
Regulation 5: 

 
    Provided further that the Member, other than that designated as Chairperson 

of a Forum shall not be of a rank which is lower, by more than one step, than 
the rank held by the Member designated as Chairperson of that Forum: 

 
    Provided further that no such officer shall be designated as Member-cum-

Chairperson of an additional Forum established, or to be established as per 
Sub-regulation (2) and Sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, who is posted in 
operation Sub-division/Division/ Circle, as the case may be, in the territorial 
jurisdiction of that Forum or of such other additional Forum which is chaired 
by an officer posted in the territorial jurisdiction of that Forum;”; and 

 
   (ii) for Sub-clause (a) of clause (ii), the following shall be substituted, 

namely :— 
 
    “(a) who have retired after serving the State Government or of its 

Undertakings at the posts which are not lower, by more than one step, than 
the rank held by the Chairperson of that Forum and are familiar with the 
consumer affairs or regulatory affairs; or” ; and 

 
 (II)  for sub-regulation (3), the following shall be substituted, namely :— 
 
  “(3) The licensee shall immediately, but not later than seven days, after the 

appointment, or designation, of the Members (other than the Independent Member) 
provide details to the Commission regarding qualifications and experience of the 
Member(s) so appointed or designated.” 

 

 6. Amendment of Regulation 9.—In Regulation 9 of the said Regulations.— 
 

(i) in sub-regulation (1), for the sign “.”, the sign “:” shall be substituted and 
thereafter the following proviso shall be inserted, namely :— 
 

 “Provided that in cases where the Members of the Forums are to be designated, on 
Ex-officio basis, as per the provisos to clause (i) of sub-regulation (1) of 
Regulation 7, the Member designated as such, shall be the Chairperson of that 
Forum.” ; and 

 

(ii) in Sub-regulation (3), for the words, brackets, sign and figures “Member appointed 
under sub-clause (b) of clause (i) of sub- regulation (1) of regulation 7”, the 



 

 

7009jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
words, brackets, sign and figures “Member appointed under sub-clause (b) of 
clause (i) of Sub-regulation (1) of Regulation 7, or the other Member designated 
as per the provisos thereto” shall be substituted. 
 

 7. Amendment  of  Regulation  13.—In  Regulation  13  of  the  said Regulations.—In 
clause (a) of Sub-regulation (1), for the words “the Members appointed,”, the words and sign “the 
Members appointed, or designated on ex-officio basis,” shall be substituted. 
 
 8. Amendment  of  Regulation  14.—In  Regulation  14  of  the  said Regulations.—In 
Sub-regulation (2), for the sign “.”, the sign “:” shall be substituted and thereafter the following 
proviso shall be inserted, namely:— 
 
 “Provided that in each case where an additional Forum is established as per Sub-regulation 
(2) and Sub-regulation (3) of Regulation 5, the distribution licensee shall designate, on Ex-officio 
basis, a suitable serving official, who shall perform his duties as Secretary of the Forum in addition 
to his normal assigned duties.” 

 
 9. Amendment of Regulation 15.—In Regulation 15 of the said Regulations, at the 
end of para, the following sentence shall be added, namely :— “The distribution licensee shall 
also provide a link on its web portal and mobile app for registering the complaint/grievance in 
relevant Forum and also shall provide online tracking system of the complaints as well as status of 
compliance of the Forum’s order by it.” 
 
 10. Amendment of Regulation 16.—In Regulation 16 of the said Regulations.—In 
Sub-regulation (1), for the words “under the jurisdiction of the Forum”, the words “under the 
jurisdiction of the relevant Forum” shall be substituted. 
 
 11. Amendment  of  Regulation 17.—In  Regulation  17  of  the  said Regulations.— 
In Sub-regulation (1), for the words and sign “submit his grievance, either in person or through 
post, e-mail or fax or online through the website of the Forum”, the words and sign “submit his 
grievance to the relevant Forum, through any channel i.e. in person, through post, e- mail, fax, 
online through the website / mobile app of the distribution licensee,” shall be substituted. 
 
 12. Amendment of  Regulation  26.—In  Regulation  26  of  the  said Regulations.— 
 
 (I) in Sub-clause (ii) of clause (a) of Sub-regulation (2), for the words and figure “15 

percent”, the words and figure “12 percent” shall be substituted; 
 
 (II) in Sub-regulation (4), for the words “The Order of the Forum shall be reasoned”, the 

words “The Order of the Forum shall be speaking and reasoned” shall be substituted; 
and 

 

 (III) in Sub-regulation (6), at the end of para, the following new sentence shall be added, 
namely :— 

 

  “Each such order shall also be displayed on the website of the distribution licensee.” 
 

 13. Amendment of Regulation 27.—In Regulation 27 of the said Regulations.—In 
Sub-regulation (1), for the words and figure “21 days”, the words and figure “30 days” shall be 
substituted. 
 

 14. Amendment of  Regulation  29.—In  Regulation  29  of  the  said Regulations.—In 
clause (a) of Sub-regulation (4), for the words “with regards to levels”, the words “duly taking into 
account the levels” shall be substituted. 



 7010        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 15. Amendment of Regulation  37.—In  Regulation  37  of  the  said Regulations.—In 
Sub-regulation (5), for the words and figure “15 days”, the words and figure “30 days” shall be 
substituted. 
 
 16. Amendment of Regulation  38.—In  Regulation  38  of  the  said Regulations.—In 
clause (a) of Sub-regulation (4), for the words “with regards to levels”, the words “duly taking into 
account the levels” shall be substituted. 

 
By order of the Commission 

 
Sd/- 

(CHAAVI NANTA) HPAS,  
Secretary. 

 
_________  

 
 
 

c vnkyr lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh /keZ'kkyk] rglhy /keZ'kkyk]  
ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0 iz0½ 

 
eqdíek ua0%   /NT@2021  
  
 Sh. Moti Lal s/o Sh. Rattan Chand, r/o Village Barol, P.O. Dari, Tehsil Dharamshala, 
District Kangra (H.P.).  
 

cuke 
 

vke turk 
  

fo"k;-&&izkFkZuk&i= tsjs /kkjk 13¼3½ fgekpy izns'k iathdj.k vf/kfu;e] 1969- 
 
uksfVl cuke vke turkA 
  
 Sh. Moti Lal s/o Sh. Rattan Chand, r/o Village Barol, P.O. Dari, Tehsil Dharamshala, 
District Kangra (H.P.) us bl vnkyr esa 'kiFk&i= lfgr eqdÌek nk;j fd;k gS fd esjh csVh dk tUe 
fnukad 20&03&2003 dks gqvk gS ijUrq ,e0lh0 /keZ'kkyk@xzke iapk;r esa tUe iathd`r u gSA vr% bls 
iathd`r fd;s tkus ds vkns'k fn;s tk;saA bl uksfVl ds }kjk leLr turk dks rFkk lEcfU/kr lEcfU/k;ksa 
dks lwfpr fd;k tkrk gS fd ;fn fdlh dks Madhu d/o Moti Lal ds tUe dks iathd`r fd;s tkus ckjs 
dksbZ ,rjkt gks rks og gekjh vnkyr esa fnukad 31&01&2022 dks vlkyru ;k odkyru gkftj vkdj 
viuk ,rjkt is'k dj ldrk gS vU;Fkk eqrkfcd 'kiFk&i= tUe frfFk 20&03&2003 dks iathd`r fd;s 
tkus ckjs vkns'k ikfjr dj fn;s tk;saxsA 

 
 
vkt fnukad 23&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj vnkyr }kjk tkjh fd;k x;kA 

 
 

eksgjA   gLrk{kfjr@& 
    lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] 
    /keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½A  



 

 

7011jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
c vnkyr lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh /keZ'kkyk] rglhy /keZ'kkyk]  

ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0 iz0½ 
 

eqdíek ua0%   /NT@2021  
  
 Sh. Ami Chand s/o Late Sh. Chuhru Ram, r/o Village Traimblu, P.O. Dhagwar, Tehsil 
Dharamshala, District Kangra (H.P.).  
 

cuke 
 

vke turk 
  

fo"k;-&&izkFkZuk&i= tsjs /kkjk 13¼3½ fgekpy izns'k iathdj.k vf/kfu;e] 1969- 
 
uksfVl cuke vke turkA 
  
 Sh. Ami Chand s/o Late Sh. Chuhru Ram, r/o Village Traimblu, P.O. Dhagwar, Tehsil 
Dharamshala, District Kangra (H.P.) us bl vnkyr esa 'kiFk&i= lfgr eqdÌek nk;j fd;k gS fd esjh 
cgu dh e`R;q fnukad 15&10&1989 dks gqbZ gS ijUrq ,e0lh0 /keZ'kkyk@xzke iapk;r esa e`R;q iathd`r u gSA 
vr% bls iathd`r fd;s tkus ds vkns'k fn;s tk;saA bl uksfVl ds }kjk leLr turk dks rFkk lEcfU/kr 
lEcfU/k;ksa dks lwfpr fd;k tkrk gS fd ;fn fdlh dks Sarla Devi d/o Churhu dh e`R;q dks iathd`r fd;s 
tkus ckjs dksbZ ,rjkt gks rks og gekjh vnkyr esa fnukad 31&01&2022 dks vlkyru ;k odkyru 
gkftj vkdj viuk ,rjkt is'k dj ldrk gS vU;Fkk eqrkfcd 'kiFk&i= e`R;q frfFk 15&10&1989 dks 
iathd`r fd;s tkus ckjs vkns'k ikfjr dj fn;s tk;saxsA 

 
vkt fnukad 23&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj vnkyr }kjk tkjh fd;k x;kA 
 

eksgjA   gLrk{kfjr@& 
    lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] 
    /keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½A  
 

&&&&&&&&&&&& 

 
c vnkyr lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh /keZ'kkyk] rglhy /keZ'kkyk]  

ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0 iz0½ 
 

eqdíek ua0%   /NT@2021  
  
 Sh. Goldi Kumar s/o Soto Ram, r/o Charan Khad, Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra 
(H.P.).  
 

cuke 
 

vke turk 
  

fo"k;-&&izkFkZuk&i= tsjs /kkjk 13¼3½ fgekpy izns'k iathdj.k vf/kfu;e] 1969- 
 

uksfVl cuke vke turkA 
  
 Sh. Goldi Kumar s/o Soto Ram, r/o Charan Khad, Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra 
(H.P.) us bl vnkyr esa 'kiFk&i= lfgr eqdÌek nk;j fd;k gS fd esjh csVh dk tUe fnukad 



 7012        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
13&11&2019 dks gqvk gS ijUrq ,e0lh0 /keZ'kkyk@xzke iapk;r esa tUe iathd`r u gSA vr% bls iathd`r 
fd;s tkus ds vkns'k fn;s tk;saA bl uksfVl ds }kjk leLr turk dks rFkk lEcfU/kr lEcfU/k;ksa dks lwfpr 
fd;k tkrk gS fd ;fn fdlh dks Saniya d/o Goldi Kumar ds tUe dks iathd`r fd;s tkus ckjs dksbZ 
,rjkt gks rks og gekjh vnkyr esa fnukad 31&01&2022 dks vlkyru ;k odkyru gkftj vkdj viuk 
,rjkt is'k dj ldrk gS vU;Fkk eqrkfcd 'kiFk&i= tUe frfFk 13&11&2019 dks iathd`r fd;s tkus ckjs 
vkns'k ikfjr dj fn;s tk;saxsA 

 
vkt fnukad 23&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj vnkyr }kjk tkjh fd;k x;kA 
 
 

eksgjA   gLrk{kfjr@& 
    lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] 
    /keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½A  
 
 

 
&&&&&&&&&&&&  

 
 

c vnkyr lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh /keZ'kkyk] rglhy /keZ'kkyk]  
ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0 iz0½ 

 
eqdíek ua0%   /NT@2021  
  
 Sh. Pathan Singh s/o Late Sh. Sarad Ram, r/o Village & P.O. Mandal, Tehsil Dharamshala, 
District Kangra (H.P.).  
 

cuke 
 

vke turk 
  

fo"k;-&&izkFkZuk&i= tsjs /kkjk 13¼3½ fgekpy izns'k iathdj.k vf/kfu;e] 1969- 
 
uksfVl cuke vke turkA 
  
  

 Sh. Pathan Singh s/o Late Sh. Sarad Ram, r/o Village & P.O. Mandal, Tehsil Dharamshala, 
District Kangra (H.P.) us bl vnkyr esa 'kiFk&i= lfgr eqdÌek nk;j fd;k gS fd esjh csVh dk tUe 
fnukad 17&11&1981 dks gqvk gS ijUrq ,e0lh0 /keZ'kkyk@xzke iapk;r esa tUe iathd`r u gSA vr% bls 
iathd`r fd;s tkus ds vkns'k fn;s tk;saA bl uksfVl ds }kjk leLr turk dks rFkk lEcfU/kr lEcfU/k;ksa 
dks lwfpr fd;k tkrk gS fd ;fn fdlh dks Kumari Pinki d/o Pathan Singh ds tUe dks iathd`r fd;s 
tkus ckjs dksbZ ,rjkt gks rks og gekjh vnkyr esa fnukad 31&01&2022 dks vlkyru ;k odkyru 
gkftj vkdj viuk ,rjkt is'k dj ldrk gS vU;Fkk eqrkfcd 'kiFk&i= tUe frfFk 17&11&1981 dks 
iathd`r fd;s tkus ckjs vkns'k ikfjr dj fn;s tk;saxsA 

 
vkt fnukad 23&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj vnkyr }kjk tkjh fd;k x;kA 
 
 

eksgjA   gLrk{kfjr@& 
    lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] 
    /keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½A  



 

 

7013jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
c vnkyr uk;c rglhynkj ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] rglhy /khjk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½ 

 
dsl ua0 % 18@NT/2021 rkjh[k nk;jk % 16&08&2021             rkjh[k is'kh % 31&01&2022 

 
fdLe eq0 % bUnzkt tUe frfFk 
 
'kh"kZd-& jtuh dqekjh iq=h Jh lksgu yky] fuoklh xkao] Mkd?kj o xzke iapk;r MabZ] rglhy /khjk] ftyk 

dkaxM+k  ¼fg0iz0½  - - izkfFkZ;kA 
   

cuke 
 
 

     
 1- yksdy jftLVªkj tUe ,oa e`R;q iathdj.k@ fookg   
 2- vke turk      - -izR;kFkhZx.kA 
 
 
fo"k;-&&izkFkZuk&i= v/khu /kkjk 13¼3½ tUe@e`R;q iathdj.k vf/kfu;e] 1969- 
  
 izkfFkZ;k mijksDr us bl U;k;ky; esa izkFkZuk&i= e; 'kiFk&i= bl vk'k; ls is'k fd;k gS fd 
mudk tUe xkao] Mkd?kj o xzke iapk;r MabZ] rglhy /khjk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½ esa fnukad 
18&02&1982 dks gqvk gSA exj vKkurko'k mudh tUe frfFk lEcfU/kr xzke iapk;r MabZ ds vfHkys[k esa 
ntZ u gS ftls fd og lEcfU/kr xzke iapk;r MabZ ds vfHkys[k esa ntZ djokuk pkgrh gSA 
 
 vr% bl ckjs bZ'rgkj jkti=  fg0 iz0 o eqL=h equknh }kjk mijksDr izR;kFkhZ o loZlk/kkj.k dks 
lwfpr fd;k tkrk gS fd ;fn fdlh dks mDr tUe iathdj.k ckjs dksbZ mtj ;k ,rjkt gks rks og bl 
bZ'rgkj@uksfVl ds tkjh gksus dh frfFk ls ,d ekg ds Hkhrj ;k fnukad 31&01&2022 dks izkr% 10-30 cts 
vlkyru ;k odkyru bl vnkyr esa gkftj vkdj viuk mtj o ,rjkt is'k dj ldrk gSA blds 
mijkUr dksbZ Hkh mtj ;k ,rjkt dkcys lek;r u gksxk rFkk vkosfndk dh tUe frfFk fnukad 
18&02&1982 dks ntZ djus ds vkns'k lEcfU/kr xzke iapk;r MabZ dks ikfjr dj fn;s tk;saxsA 
 

 
 vkt fnukad 31&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj lfgr vnkyr ls tkjh gqvkA 
 
eksgjA   gLrk{kfjr@& 
    uk;c rglhynkj ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] 

 /khjk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0 iz0½A 
 

----------------- 
 

c vnkyr lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh /keZ'kkyk] rglhy /keZ'kkyk]  
ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½ 

 
eqdíek ua0  NT@2021  
 
 Jh iqfu yky iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke] fuoklh lksduh nk dksV] Mkd?kj [kfu;kjk] rglhy 
/keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½  
 

cuke 
 

vke turk 



 7014        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
fo"k;-&&izkFkZuk&i= tsjs /kkjk 37¼2½ fgekpy izns'k uke nq#Lrh djus ckjsA 
 
uksfVl cuke vke turkA 
  
 Jh iqfu yky iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke] fuoklh lksduh nk dksV] Mkd?kj [kfu;kjk] rglhy 
/keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½ us bl vnkyr esa 'kiFk&i= lfgr eqdÌek nk;j fd;k gS fd esjk uke 
jktLo fjdkMZ egky trsgM esa iqUuw jke iq= jk¡>k ntZ gS tksfd xyr gS tcfd esjk uke iqfu yky iq= 
jk¡>k gSA bl uksfVl ds }kjk leLr turk dks rFkk lEcfU/kr lEcfU/k;ksa dks lwfpr fd;k tkrk gS fd ;fn 
fdlh dks iqfu yky iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke nq#Lrh ckjs dksbZ ,rjkTk gks rks og viuk ,rjkt gekjh 
vnkyr esa fnukad 31&01&2022 dks vlkyru ;k odkyru gkftj vkdj is'k dj ldrk gS vU;Fkk 
eqrkfcd 'kiFk&i= iqfu yky iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke ds uke dh nq#Lrh iathd`r fd;s tkus ckjs vkns'k 
ikfjr dj fn;s tk;saxsA 

 
vkt fnukad 23&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj vnkyr }kjk tkjh fd;k x;kA 
 
 
 

eksgjA   gLrk{kfjr@& 
    lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] 
    /keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½A  
 
 

&&&&&&&&&&&&& 
 

 
 

c vnkyr lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh /keZ'kkyk] rglhy /keZ'kkyk]  
ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½ 

 
eqdíek ua0  NT@2021  
 
 Jh txnh'k pUn iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke] fuoklh lksduh nk dksV] Mkd?kj [kfu;kjk] rglhy 
/keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½  
 

cuke 
 

vke turk 

  
fo"k;-&&izkFkZuk&i= tsjs /kkjk 37¼2½ fgekpy izns'k uke nq#Lrh djus ckjsA 
 
 
uksfVl cuke vke turkA 

  
 Jh txnh'k pUn iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke] fuoklh lksduh nk dksV] Mkd?kj [kfu;kjk] rglhy 
/keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½ us bl vnkyr esa 'kiFk&i= lfgr eqdÌek nk;j fd;k gS fd esjk uke 
jktLo fjdkMZ egky tVsgM esa flejks nsoh iq=h jk¡tk ntZ gS tksfd xyr gS tcdh esjk uke txnh'k pUn 
iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke gSA bl uksfVl ds }kjk leLr turk dks rFkk lEcfU/kr lEcfU/k;ksa dks lwfpr 
fd;k tkrk gS fd ;fn fdlh dks txnh'k pUn iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke nq#Lrh ckjs dksbZ ,rjkTk gks rks 
og viuk ,rjkt gekjh vnkyr esa fnukad 31&01&2022 dks vlkyru ;k odkyru gkftj vkdj is'k 



 

 

7015jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
dj ldrk gS vU;Fkk eqrkfcd 'kiFk&i= txnh'k pUn iq= LoxhZ; Jh jk¡>k jke ds uke dh nq#Lrh 
iathd`r fd;s tkus ckjs vkns'k ikfjr dj fn;s tk;saxsA 

 
vkt fnukad 23&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj vnkyr }kjk tkjh fd;k x;kA 
 
 

eksgjA   gLrk{kfjr@& 
    lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] 
    /keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½A 
  
 

&&&&&&&&&&&&& 
 
 
 
 

c vnkyr lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh /keZ'kkyk] rglhy /keZ'kkyk]  
ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½ 

 
eqdíek ua0  NT@2021  
 
 Jherh Misro Devi w/o Late Sh. Prem Chand, Village Kasba Narwana, P.O. Yol Cant, 
Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra.  
 
 

cuke 
 

vke turk 
  

fo"k;-&&izkFkZuk&i= tsjs /kkjk 37¼2½ fgekpy izns'k uke nq#Lrh djus ckjsA 
 
uksfVl cuke vke turkA 
  
 
 Jherh Misro Devi w/o Late Sh. Prem Chand, Village Kasba Narwana, P.O. Yol Cant, 
Tehsil Dharamshala, District Kangra us bl vnkyr esa 'kiFk&i= lfgr eqdÌek nk;j fd;k gS fd esjs 
ifr dk uke jktLo fjdkMZ egky dlck esa Mxk iq= e[kkSyh ntZ gS] tksfd xyr gSA tcdh esjs ifr dk  
uke izse pUn iq= e[kkSyh gSA bl uksfVl ds }kjk leLr turk dks rFkk lEcfU/kr lEcfU/k;ksa dks lwfpr 
fd;k tkrk gS fd ;fn fdlh dks isze pUn iq= e[kkSyh dh nq#Lrh ckjs dksbZ ,rjkTk gks rks og viuk 
,rjkt gekjh vnkyr esa fnukad 31&01&2022 dks vlkyru ;k odkyru gkftj vkdj is'k dj ldrk gS 
vU;Fkk eqrkfcd 'kiFk&i= isze pUn iq= e[kkSyh ds uke dh nq#Lrh iathd`r fd;s tkus ckjs vkns'k ikfjr 
dj fn;s tk;saxsA 

 
 
vkt fnukad 23&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj vnkyr }kjk tkjh fd;k x;kA 
 
 
 

eksgjA   gLrk{kfjr@&  
    lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh ,oa dk;Zdkjh n.Mkf/kdkjh] 
   /keZ'kkyk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0iz0½A  



 7016        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
c vnkyr Jh lqHkk"k dqekj] uk;c rglhynkj ,oa lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh] rglhy /khjk]  

ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0 iz0½ 
 

dsl ua0 % 29@NT/2021 rkjh[k nk;jk % 11&11&2021 rkjh[k is'kh % 31&01&2022 
           
 
'kh"kZd-&Jh d'kehj flag iq= [kse pUn] fuoklh egky pEch] ekStk j>aw] rglhy /khjk] ftyk dkaxM+k     

¼fg0 iz0½                                                                     - - izkFkhZA 
   

 

cuke 
 

  
 vke turk   - -izR;kFkhZx.kA 

 
fo"k;-&&cjk;s uke nq#Lrh fg0 iz0 Hkw&jktLo vf/kfu;e] 1954 dh /kkjk 37¼3½ ds vUrxZrA  
 
 izkFkhZ mijksDr us bl vnkyr esa izkFkZuk&i= e; 'kiFk&i= bl vk'k; ls is'k fd;k gS fd mlds 
Lo0 firk dk lgh uke [kse pUn iq= ykHkk gS tcfd egky pEch] ekStk j>aw] ds jktLo vfHkys[k esa [khek 
miuke [kUxw n'kkZ;k x;k gS] tks fd xyr gSA vr% egky pEch] ekStk j>aw]  ds jktLo vfHkys[k esa mudk 
uke nq#Lr fd;k tk;sA 

  
 vr% bl ckjs loZlk/kkj.k dks bl jkti= b'rgkj o eqL=h equknh ds }kjk lwfpr fd;k tkrk gS 
fd ;fn fdlh dks mDr uke dh nq#Lrh ckjs dksbZ mtj ;k ,rjkt gks rks og fnukad 31&01&2022 dks 
izkr% 10-30 cts vlkyru ;k odkyru gkftj vnkyr vkdj viuk mtj ;k ,rjkt is'k dj ldrk gSA 
blds mijkUr dksbZ Hkh mtj ;k ,rjkt tsjs lek;r u gksxk rFkk vkosnd ds firk ds uke nq#Lrh ds 
vkns'k ikfjr dj fn;s tk;saxsA 
 
 vkt fnukad 31&12&2021 dks esjs gLrk{kj o eksgj lfgr vnkyr ls tkjh fd;k x;kA 
  

eksgjA      gLrk{kfjr@& 
lgk;d lekgrkZ f}rh; Js.kh] 

rglhy /khjk] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0 iz0½A 
 

&&&&&&&& 
 

In the Court of Shri B. R. Sharma, Sub-Divisional Magistrate, Shimla (R),  
District Shimla (H. P.) 

 

 Sh. Naresh Kumar Sharma s/o Sh Hari Ram Sharma r/o Village Panihana, P.O. Toon, Sub-
Tehsil Dhami,  District  Shimla,  Himachal Pradesh. 
 

Versus 
 

 

 General Public . . Respondent. 

  
 Whereas Sh. Naresh Kumar Sharma s/o Sh Hari Ram Sharma r/o Village Panihana, P.O. 
Toon, Sub-Tehsil Dhami,  District  Shimla,  Himachal Pradesh has filed an application alongwith 
affidavit in the court of undersigned under section 13(3) of the Birth & Death Registration Act, 
1969 to enter the name/date of birth of his daughter named— Miss Neha Sharma d/o Sh. Naresh 



 

 

7017jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
Kumar Sharma  r/o Village Panihana, P.O. Toon, Sub-Tehsil Dhami,  District  Shimla,  Himachal 
Pradesh in the record of Secy.-cum-Registrar Birth and Death, Gram Panchayat Piplidhar, Sub- 
Tehsil Dhami, District Shimla, Himachal Pradesh.  
 

 
Sl. 
No. 

Name of the family member Relation Date of Birth 

1. Miss Neha Sharma Daughter 30-01-2000 

 
 Hence, this proclamation is issued to the general public if they have any objection/claim 
regarding entery of the name/date of birth of above named in the record of Secy.-cum-Registrar 
Birth and Death, Gram Panchayat Piplidhar Sub-Tehsil Dhami, District Shimla, Himachal Pradesh, 
may file their claims/objections on or before one month of publication of this notice in Govt. 
Gazette in this court, failing which necessary orders will be passed.    
 
 Issued today 31-12-2021 under my signature and seal of the court. 
 

Seal.    Sd/- 
Sub-Divisional Magistrate, 

Shimla (R), District Shimla (H.P.). 
 

__________  
 
 

lwpuk 
 

 loZjk/kkj.k o vke turk dks lwfpr fd;k tkrk gS fd esjs iq= ds uke dh Lisfyax xyr gS tksfd 
RAKSHBIR SINGH xyr fy[kh x;h Fkh ftldk 'kqf)dj.k eSaus ekU; U;k;ky; nhokuh U;k;/kh'k cStukFk] 
ftyk dkaxM+k] Civil Suit No. 37/2018, fnukad 06&03&2018 }kjk uke dh Lisfyax dks RAKSHVEER 
SINGH djok fy;k gS Hkfo"; esa blds lHkh nLrkostks esa uke dh Lisfyax RAKSHVEER SINGH gh i<+h 
o le>h tk,A  
 
 

johUnz Bkdqj] 
iq= 'ke'ksj flag] 

 xkao egknso] Mkd?kj ?kusV] 
rg0 ikyeiqj] ftyk dkaxM+k ¼fg0 iz0½A 

 
 
 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 



 7018        jkti=] fgekpy izns'k] 27 tuojh] 2022@7 ek?k] 1943         
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
fu;U=d] eqnz.k rFkk ys[ku lkexzh] fgekpy izns'k] f'keyk&5 }kjk eqfnzr rFkk izdkf'kr 

bysDVªkWfud gLrk{kfjr jkti=] oSclkbV http://rajpatrahimachal.nic.in ij miyC/k gS ,oe~ vkWuykbu lR;kfir fd;k tk ldrk gSA 


		2022-01-27T15:37:30+0530
	Uma Shankar




