Regn.No. KERBIL/2012/45073
ated 05-09-2012 with RNI

Reg No.KL/TV (N)/634/2021-2023

©
CHOE MBBOHID
Government of Kerala
2023

- N9 - g
CHOG NTVQ
KERALA GAZETTE

G VoWomeMo
EXTRAORDINARY

GRW®IQ1H2IW] (aIM]EDOA SO0

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

® 1) UMD L) o, 2023 @RV 10
10th August 2023
Qudello 12 Qlfo¥o —
Vol i;’ | J 1198 BHBHOSo 25 m“,\’fc‘? 2674
. Thiruvananthapuram, 25th Karkadakam 1198
Thursday 1945 (WO U6Mo 19
19th Sravana 1945
SECRETARIAT OF THE KERALA LEGISLATURE
NOTIFICATION
No0.18998/Legn-3/2022/Leg Dated, Thiruvananthapuram, 10" August 2023.

The Subject Committee report on The Kerala Motor Transport Workers' Payment Of Fair Wages (Amendment)

Bill, 2022and the Bill as reported by the Subject Committee is published, under rule 231(1) read with 237(3)of the Rules

of Procedure and Conduct of Business in the Kerala Legislative Assembly.

A. M. Basheer,
Secretary.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




THE KERALA MOTOR TRANSPORT WORKERS' PAYMENT OF FAIR WAGES
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022

(Report of the Subject Committee)

Subject Committee VII (Electricity, Labour and Labour Welfare) to which
“The Kerala Motor Transport Workers' Payment of Fair Wages (Amendment) Bill, 2022” was referred, considered the Bill
(Bill No. 142) clause by clause and now submits its report with the Bill as reported by the Committee annexed
thereto.

2. The Kerala Motor Transport Workers' Payment of Fair Wages (Amendment) Bill, 2022 was published as a
Gazette Extraordinary dated 1% November, 2022. The Bill was introduced in the Assembly on 8" August, 2023
and was referred to the Subject Committee on the same day.

3. The Subject Committee VII (Electricity, Labour and Labour Welfare) considered the Bill clause by clause
at its meeting held on 8™ August, 2023 and recommends to adopt the Bill with the following modifications.

Enacting formula
For the words and symbol “Seventy-third”, the words and symbol “Seventy-fourth” shall be substituted.
Clause 1
In sub-clause (1), for the figure “2022”, the figure “2023” shall be substituted.
Clause 2
(i) In item (i),—

(a) for the brackets and letters “(ac)” wherever it occurs, the brackets and letters “(ab)” shall be
substituted;

(b) sub-item (aa) shall be omitted,;

(c) sub-item (ab) shall be re-lettered as (aa);

(ii) In item (ii), sub-items (ac), (ad) and (ae) shall respectively be re-lettered as (ab), (ac) and (ad).
Clause 3

(i) in the Marginal Heading of clause 3A proposed to be inserted, for the words “for malicious or vexatious
claims”, the word “thereof” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (1), the words and symbol “any Commissioner for Employees' Compensation or” shall be
omitted;

(iii) sub-clause (4) shall be omitted and sub-clauses (5), (6) and (7) shall respectively be re-numbered as
(4), (5) and (6);
(iv) in sub-clause (4) so re-numbered, the words, symbols, number and brackets “or sub-section (4)” shall

be omitted;

(v) in sub-clause (5) so re-numbered, the words, symbol, number and brackets “or sub-section (4), as the
case may be,” shall be omitted;

(vi) in the proviso to sub-clause (5) so re-numbered, the words, symbols, figure and brackets “or sub-
section (4), as the case may be,” shall be omitted.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




Clause 4
In clause 4, for the words “five thousand rupees” the words “two thousand rupees” shall be substituted.
4. All other changes are either verbal or consequential.

5. The minutes of dissent and the Bill as reported by the Subject Committee are appended.

K. KRISHNANKUTTY,

Thiruvananthapuram, Chairman,
10th August, 2023. Subject Committee VII.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




APPENDIX- |
ofleoRMe30Iaf

MPVMW GaIMMo  LIEHNIAN@IOM®N0 H@IFILNSHhUlan @RAIMRHIVNINGEe TVAG[lesIM@IMSs AIRITLNG:Ud 1971-0el
€226398 A19a0M A®IFILNE]HRUBHH” MHHVNIV EAMMo MTHOS BRYL 1T QUBNAISADIN@IM” AJAINO §.2IQIEM” AT HH*HING
AMIS8s®.  CaImMo LIS AVoMIMWIa]  @RAIGH00000B6BU3  2MWIEBM®”  MoMITWlaf Aldaf  3(af)(2)-0e1
QAINOVIGE 2FM@ AULGM® BRYAINVIAIAM”. AWM aflel AIdRLMAje ERIEZIB AAOM ME:@1Vleje 29" ENAIMEBEHS anlay”
OMOMILRBB AIGRLMOYHBo  B®HOVEMo  EROE308 ANaOM caaRIVI@ aell® @@lrvaw]l mlemlelesm. 208308 Aa0Mm

O®IFILNGBHBOS  H@IFIT  MYOBH D0 IESMM@INSBE  MSalSldud  Mfl::alenom@Imomd  mileflemos”  afllewoelef

GO6UNQ|SODATO.
@RMAIB VIR (8a)
af).0d.af)o. BRaHOal’ (82)

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




APPENDIX- II
THE KERALA MOTOR TRANSPORT WORKERS' PAYMENT OF FAIR WAGES
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022
(As reported by the Subject Committee)
[The words underlined indicate the modifications suggested by the committee. Omissions are indicated by asterisks ]
A
BILL
further to amend the Kerala Motor Transport Workers' Payment of Fair Wages  Act, 1971.

Preamble.—WHeREas, it is expedient further to amend the Kerala Motor Transport Workers' Payment of Fair Wages
Act, 1971, (23 of 1971) for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted in the Seventy-fourth Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Kerala Motor Transport Workers' Payment of Fair
Wages (Amendment) Act, 2023.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Government may, by notification in the Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 2.—In the Kerala Motor Transport Workers' Payment of Fair Wages Act, 1971 (23 of 1971),
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act) in section 2,—

(i) the existing clause (a) shall be re-lettered as clause (ab) and before clause (ab) as so re-lettered, the following
clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(a) “authority” means the authority appointed under section 3A of the Act;
[***]

756/2023. (aa) “Deputy Labour Commissioner” means the Deputy Labour Commissioner of the State having

jurisdiction in the respective areas;”;
(ii) after clause (ab), as so re-lettered, the following clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

(ac) “Inspector” means the Chief Inspector or any Inspector appointed under section 4 of the Motor
Transport Workers Act, 1961 (Central Act 27 of 1961);

(ad) “Labour Commissioner” means the Labour Commissioner of the State of Kerala;”.
(iii) after clause (d) the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—
(e) “Government” means Government of Kerala.

3. Insertion of new section 3A.—After section 3 of the principal Act, the following section shall be inserted,
namely:—

“3A. Claims arising out of non-payment of fair wages and penalty thereof.—(1) The Government may, by
notification in the Gazette, appoint [***] an officer not below the rank of a Deputy Labour Commissioner of the State
Government to hear and decide for any specified area, all claims arising out of payment of less than the fair wages to the
motor transport workers employed or paid in that area, including all matters incidental to such claims.

Thisisadigitaly signed Gazette.
Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/




(2) Where a motor transport worker has any such claim of the nature referred to in sub-section (1), he himself or
any legal practitioner or any officialof a registered trade union authorised in writing to act on behalf of such
worker or any Inspector or any  person acting  with  the permission of  the
authority appointed under sub-section (1) may apply to such authority for a direction under sub-section (3):

Provided that every such application shall be presented in such form as may be prescribed, within six months, from
the date on which the fair wages become payable:

Provided further that any such application may be admitted after the said period of six months, if the applicant
satisfies the authority that he hadsufficient cause for not making the application within such period.

(3) When any application under sub-section (2) is entertained, the authority shall hear the applicant and the
employer responsible for the payment of fair wages under section 3, or give them an opportunity of being heard, and after
such further enquiry, if any, as it may deem necessary, the authority may, without prejudice to any other penalty to which
the employer may be liable under this Act, direct that payment shall be made to the motor transport worker,
of the amount by which the amount actually paid to him falls short of the fair wages actually payable to him, together with
the payment of such compensation as the authority may think fit, not exceeding ten times the amount of such
deficit.

[***]

4 If any amount directed to be paid wunder sub-section (3) [***] s
not paid by the person liable for the payment thereof, within the time limit fixed by the authority in this behalf, the
authority shall, on application made to it by the person entitled thereto, either directly or by any person authorised by him in
writing, issue a certificate for that amount to the Collector, who shall recover the same as arrears of public revenue due on

land and pay the same to the person entitled thereto.

(5) Any person aggrieved by an order under sub-section (3) [***] may, within sixty days from the date of

receipt of the order, prefer an appeal to the Labour Commissioner (hereinafter referred to as the appellate authority):

Provided that no appeal shall be admitted unless, at the time of preferring the appeal, the appellant either produces a
certificate issued by the authority to the effect that he has deposited an amount equal to the amount required to be

paid under sub-section (3) [***] or deposits such amount with the appellate authority.

(6) The appellate authority may, after giving the parties to the appeal an opportunity of being heard, confirm,

modify or revise the decision of the authority.”.

4. Amendment of section 4.—In section 4 of the principal Act, for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “two
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 6.—In sub-section (1) of section 6 of the principal Act, for the word “authority”, the word
“Inspector” shall be substituted.

Kerala Legislature Secretariat, A.M. BASHEER,
Thiruvananthapuram, Secretary.
8th August 2023.

PUBLISHED BY THE SUPERINTENDENT OF GOVERNMENT PRESSES
AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, THIRUVANANTHAPURAM, 2023 -

Digitally signed by Veeran T

Thisisadigitally signed Gazette. Date:2023.08.10 07:38:33 +05:30

Authenticity may be verified through https://compose.kerala.gov.in/



		2023-08-10T19:39:33+0530
	Veeran T




